http://register.state.va.us Virginia Code Commission

Virginia Register of Regulations

VOL. 241SS. 1 PUBLISHED EVERY OTHER WEEK BY THE VIRGINIA CODE COMMISSION SEPTEMBER 17, 2007
TABLE OF CONTENTS

Register INFOrmation PAge .........cooviiiiii ittt et e et e e sre e e enes 1
Publication Schedule and Deadlines ..............ccoiiiiiiiiiii 2
Cumulative Table of Virginia Administrative Code Sections Adopted, Amended, or Repealed....... 3
Notices of Intended ReguIAtory ACHION ..........oiiiiiiii et 20
REGUIBLIONS ...ttt b b bbbt bt e st e e et e b e st e bt bt e b e et e e e 23
3VAC5-50. Retail Operations (Notice of Objection to Fast-Track RUIEMEKING) .......ccvoiriiiiiiiiieinec e 23
AVAC15-270. Game: Firearms (PrOPOSEA)......c.uiirueiiuirieieteiteeete sttt ettt et st se et sb etk b e ekt ab et et e e b e et e ebene et e abeneebeebe e 24
8VAC35-60. Policy Prohibiting Weapons (FINAL) ..ottt 25
9VAC25-800. Virginia Water Protection General Permit for Minor Surface Water Withdrawals (Withdrawal of

PropOSEd REGUIATION) ......cuiiteietiiteiete itttk b et bbbt b bbbt h et b bRt e bt b et e bt e b et e bt e bttt b et b b 25
16VAC25-90. Federal Identical General Industry Standards (29 CFR Part 1910) - Electrical Standard, Subpart S

OF PAIT 19T0 (FINAI) ..ttt ettt bbbt bt h e e bt et e b ekt ee e b e A b e e b e e b2 e Rees b e ee e b e e beebeeb e e seenbenaenbenbeebeas 26
18VACB85-20. Regulations Governing the Practice of Medicine, Osteopathic Medicine, Podiatry, and Chiropractic (Final) ..27
18VACB85-40. Regulations Governing the Practice of Respiratory Care Practitioners (Final) ..........ccocooviiinininiiiciicie, 28
18VACB85-40. Regulations Governing the Practice of Respiratory Care Practitioners (Final) ..........cccccocvviviivnieiicvescieie e, 29
18VACB85-50. Regulations Governing the Practice of Physician Assistants (Final)..........cccoceeviieviiiienisinsinsse e 29
18VAC85-80. Regulations Governing the Licensure of Occupational Therapists (Final)...........ccccoovviviieiieiiniecicse e 29
18VACS85-101. Regulations Governing the Licensure of Radiologic Technologists and Radiologic Technologists-

LIMITEA (FINGAL) .ttt bt bbbt b bt h b bR bbb et et e bt et et b et et eb et et en e b s 29
18VAC85-110. Regulations Governing the Practice of Licensed Acupuncturists (Final)..........ccocooviiiniiiniineeneee 29
22VAC5-30. The Virginia Public Guardian and Conservator Program (PropoSed) ..........cccoereerernienenee e 30
22VAC40-72. Standards for Licensed Assisted Living Facilities (FaSt-Track) .........cccooeveiirirniinineieneee e 36
0] 0 PO PP PR UROPRPPROT 41
GENEIAI NOTICES/ENTALA. ... ..eiivieiieieetie ettt sttt b e b e et e se et eebe st e e beebeeneenbeentennes 45

| |

THE VIRGINIA REGISTER OF REGULATIONS (USPS-001831) is published biweekly, with quarterly cumulative indices published in
January, April, July and October, for $160.00 per year by LexisNexis Matthew Bender, 1275 Broadway, Albany, NY 12204. Periodical
postage is paid at Albany, NY and at additional mailing offices. POSTMASTER: Send address changes to LexisNexis Matthew Bender,
1275 Broadway, Albany, NY 12204.



THE VIRGINIA REGISTER INFORMATION PAGE

THE VIRGINIA REGISTER OF REGULATIONS is an official state
publication issued every other week throughout the year. Indexes are
published quarterly, and are cumulative for the year. The Virginia
Register has several functions. The new and amended sections of
regulations, both as proposed and as finally adopted, are required by law
to be published in the Virginia Register. In addition, the Virginia
Register is a source of other information about state government,
including petitions for rulemaking, emergency regulations, executive
orders issued by the Governor, the Virginia Tax Bulletin issued
periodically by the Department of Taxation, and notices of public
hearings and open meetings of state agencies.

ADOPTION, AMENDMENT, AND REPEAL OF REGULATIONS
An agency wishing to adopt, amend, or repeal regulations must first
publish in the Virginia Register a notice of intended regulatory action; a
basis, purpose, substance and issues statement; an economic impact
analysis prepared by the Department of Planning and Budget; the
agency’s response to the economic impact analysis; a summary; a notice
giving the public an opportunity to comment on the proposal; and the
text of the proposed regulation.

Following publication of the proposal in the Virginia Register, the
promulgating agency receives public comments for a minimum of 60
days. The Governor reviews the proposed regulation to determine if it is
necessary to protect the public health, safety and welfare, and if it is
clearly written and easily understandable. If the Governor chooses to
comment on the proposed regulation, his comments must be transmitted
to the agency and the Registrar no later than 15 days following the
completion of the 60-day public comment period. The Governor’s
comments, if any, will be published in the Virginia Register. Not less
than 15 days following the completion of the 60-day public comment
period, the agency may adopt the proposed regulation.

The Joint Commission of Administrative Rules (JCAR) or the
appropriate standing committee of each house of the General Assembly
may meet during the promulgation or final adoption process and file an
objection with the Registrar and the promulgating agency. The objection
will be published in the Virginia Register. Within 21 days after receipt
by the agency of a legislative objection, the agency shall file a response
with the Registrar, the objecting legislative body, and the Governor.
When final action is taken, the agency again publishes the text of the
regulation as adopted, highlighting all changes made to the proposed
regulation and explaining any substantial changes made since
publication of the proposal. A 30-day final adoption period begins upon
final publication in the Virginia Register.

The Governor may review the final regulation during this time and, if he
objects, forward his objection to the Registrar and the agency. In
addition to or in lieu of filing a formal objection, the Governor may
suspend the effective date of a portion or all of a regulation until the end
of the next regular General Assembly session by issuing a directive
signed by a majority of the members of the appropriate legislative body
and the Governor. The Governor’s objection or suspension of the
regulation, or both, will be published in the Virginia Register. If the
Governor finds that changes made to the proposed regulation have
substantial impact, he may require the agency to provide an additional
30-day public comment period on the changes. Notice of the additional
public comment period required by the Governor will be published in the
Virginia Register.

The agency shall suspend the regulatory process for 30 days when it
receives requests from 25 or more individuals to solicit additional public
comment, unless the agency determines that the changes have minor or
inconsequential impact.

A regulation becomes effective at the conclusion of the 30-day final
adoption period, or at any other later date specified by the promulgating
agency, unless (i) a legislative objection has been filed, in which event
the regulation, unless withdrawn, becomes effective on the date
specified, which shall be after the expiration of the 21-day objection
period; (ii) the Governor exercises his authority to require the agency to

provide for additional public comment, in which event the regulation,
unless withdrawn, becomes effective on the date specified, which shall
be after the expiration of the period for which the Governor has provided
for additional public comment; (iii) the Governor and the General
Assembly exercise their authority to suspend the effective date of a
regulation until the end of the next regular legislative session; or (iv) the
agency suspends the regulatory process, in which event the regulation,
unless withdrawn, becomes effective on the date specified, which shall
be after the expiration of the 30-day public comment period and no
earlier than 15 days from publication of the readopted action.
Proposed regulatory action may be withdrawn by the promulgating
agency at any time before the regulation becomes final.
FAST-TRACK RULEMAKING PROCESS
Section 2.2-4012.1 of the Code of Virginia provides an exemption from
certain provisions of the Administrative Process Act for agency
regulations deemed by the Governor to be noncontroversial. To use this
process, Governor's concurrence is required and advance notice must be
provided to certain legislative committees. Fast-track regulations will
become effective on the date noted in the regulatory action if no
objections to using the process are filed in accordance with § 2.2-4012.1.
EMERGENCY REGULATIONS
If an agency demonstrates that (i) there is an immediate threat to the
public’s health or safety; or (ii) Virginia statutory law, the appropriation
act, federal law, or federal regulation requires a regulation to take effect
no later than (a) 280 days from the enactment in the case of Virginia or
federal law or the appropriation act, or (b) 280 days from the effective
date of a federal regulation, it then requests the Governor’s approval to
adopt an emergency regulation. The emergency regulation becomes
operative upon its adoption and filing with the Registrar of Regulations,
unless a later date is specified. Emergency regulations are limited to
addressing specifically defined situations and may not exceed 12 months
in duration. Emergency regulations are published as soon as possible in
the Register.
During the time the emergency status is in effect, the agency may
proceed with the adoption of permanent regulations through the usual
procedures. To begin promulgating the replacement regulation, the
agency must (i) file the Notice of Intended Regulatory Action with the
Registrar within 60 days of the effective date of the emergency
regulation and (ii) file the proposed regulation with the Registrar within
180 days of the effective date of the emergency regulation. If the agency
chooses not to adopt the regulations, the emergency status ends when the
prescribed time limit expires.
STATEMENT
The foregoing constitutes a generalized statement of the procedures to be
followed. For specific statutory language, it is suggested that Article 2
(8 2.2-4006 et seq.) of Chapter 40 of Title 2.2 of the Code of Virginia be
examined carefully.

CITATION TO THE VIRGINIA REGISTER
The Virginia Register is cited by volume, issue, page number, and date.
23:7 VA.R. 1023-1140 December 11, 2006, refers to VVolume 23, Issue
7, pages 1023 through 1140 of the Virginia Register issued on
December 11, 2006.
The Virginia Register of Regulations is published pursuant to Article 6
(8 2.2-4031 et seq.) of Chapter 40 of Title 2.2 of the Code of Virginia.
Members of the Virginia Code Commission: R. Steven Landes,
Chairman; John S. Edwards, Vice Chairman; Ryan T. McDougle;
Robert Hurt; Robert L. Calhoun; Frank S. Ferguson; E.M. Miller,
Jr.; Thomas M. Moncure, Jr.; James F. Almand; S. Bernard
Goodwyn.
Staff of the Virginia Register: Jane D. Chaffin, Registrar of Regulations;
June T. Chandler, Assistant Registrar.

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007




PUBLICATION SCHEDULE AND DEADLINES

This schedule is available on the Register's Internet home page (http://register.state.va.us).

September 2007 through June 2008

Volume: Issue

FINAL INDEX - Volume 23

24:1
24:2
24:3
24:4
24:5
24:6
24:7

INDEX 1 Volume 24

24:8

24:9

24:10
24:11
24:12
24:13
24:14

INDEX 2 Volume 24

24:15
24:16
24:17
24:18
24:19
24:20

INDEX 3 Volume 24

24:21

Material Submitted By Noon*

Will Be Published On

August 29, 2007

September 12, 2007
September 26, 2007

October 10, 2007

October 24, 2007

November 7, 2007

November 20, 2007 (Tuesday)

December 5, 2007
December 19, 2007
January 2, 2008
January 16, 2008
January 30, 2008
February 13, 2008
February 27, 2008

March 12, 2008
March 26, 2008
April 9, 2008
April 23, 2008
May 7, 2008
May 21, 2008

June 4, 2008

*Filing deadlines are Wednesdays unless otherwise specified.

October 2007

September 17, 2007
October 1, 2007
October 15, 2007
October 29, 2007
November 12, 2007
November 26, 2007
December 10, 2007

January 2008

December 24, 2008
January 7, 2008
January 21, 2008
February 4, 2008
February 18, 2008
March 3, 2008
March 17, 2008

April 2008

March 31, 2008
April 14, 2008
April 28, 2008
May 12, 2008
May 26, 2008
June 9, 2008

July 2008

June 23, 2008

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007

2



CUMULATIVE TABLE OF VIRGINIA ADMINISTRATIVE CODE
SECTIONS ADOPTED, AMENDED, OR REPEALED

The table printed below lists regulation sections, by Virginia Administrative Code (VAC) title, that have been amended,
added or repealed in the Virginia Register since the regulations were originally published or last supplemented in VAC (the
Spring 2007 VAC Supplement includes final regulations published through Virginia Register Volume 23, Issue 9, dated
January 8, 2007). Emergency regulations, if any, are listed, followed by the designation “emer,” and errata pertaining to final
regulations are listed. Proposed regulations are not listed here. The table lists the sections in numerical order and shows
action taken, the volume, issue and page number where the section appeared, and the effective date of the section.

| SECTION NUMBER | ACTION | CITE | EFFECTIVEDATE |
Title 1. Administration
1 VAC 55-30-10 through 1 VAC 55-30-90 Added 23:26 VA.R. 4413-4416 10/3/07
Title 2. Agriculture
2 VAC 5-110 (Forms) Amended 23:26 VA.R. 4452 --
2 VAC 5-195 (Form) Added 23:15VAR. 2512 --
2 VAC 5-330-30 Amended 23:20 VAR. 3122 7/12/07
2 VAC 5-490-10 through 2 VAC 5-490-90 Amended 23:20 VAR. 3123-3155 5/23/07
2 VAC 5-490-15 Added 23:20 VA.R. 3130 5/23/07
2 VAC 5-490-25 Added 23:20 VAR. 3131 5/23/07
2 VAC 5-490-31 through 2 VAC 5-490-39.6 Added 23:20 VAR. 3132-3140 5/23/07
2 VAC 5-490-73 Added 23:20 VA.R. 3154 5/23/07
2 VAC 5-490-75 Added 23:20 VA.R. 3155 5/23/07
2 VAC 5-490-103 Added 23:20 VA.R. 3155 5/23/07
2 VAC 5-490-105 Added 23:20 VA.R. 3156 5/23/07
2 VAC 5-490-110 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3156 5/23/07
2 VAC 5-490-120 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3157 5/23/07
2 VAC 5-490-130 Repealed 23:20 VA.R. 3157 5/23/07
2 VAC 5-490-131 through 2 VAC 5-490-138 Added 23:20 VA.R. 3157-3162 5/23/07
2 VAC 5-490-140 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3162 5/23/07
2 VAC 5-620-10 through 2 VAC 5-620-100 Added 23:19 VAR. 2981-2985 7/1/07
Title 3. Alcoholic Beverages
3 VAC 5-10-40 Amended 23:13 VAR. 2117 5/19/07
3 VAC 5-10-50 Amended 23:13 VAR. 2117 5/19/07
3 VAC 5-10-60 Amended 23:13 VAR. 2117 5/19/07
3 VAC 5-10-130 Amended 23:13 VAR. 2117 5/19/07
3 VAC 5-10-150 Amended 23:13 VAR. 2117 5/19/07
3 VAC 5-10-230 Amended 23:13 VAR. 2118 5/19/07
3 VAC 5-10-360 Amended 23:13 VAR. 2118 5/19/07
3 VAC 5-10-400 Amended 23:13 VAR. 2118 5/19/07
3 VAC 5-10-480 Amended 23:13 VAR. 2129 5/19/07
3 VAC 5-40-20 Amended 23:13 VAR. 2133 5/19/07
3 VAC 5-40-50 Amended 23:13VA.R. 2134 5/19/07
3 VAC 5-50-40 Amended 23:25 VAR. 4107 10/4/07
3 VAC 5-50-50 Amended 23:25 VA.R. 4108 10/4/07
3 VAC 5-50-80 Amended 23:25 VA.R. 4108 10/4/07
3 VAC 5-50-100 Amended 23:25 VA.R. 4108 10/4/07
3 VAC 5-50-130 Amended 23:25 VA.R. 4109 10/4/07
3 VAC 5-50-140 Amended 23:25 VAR. 4110 10/4/07
3 VAC 5-60-20 Amended 23:13 VAR. 2137 5/19/07
3 VAC 5-60-40 Amended 23:13 VA.R. 2138 5/19/07

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007

3



Cumulative Table of VAC Sections Adopted, Amended, or Repealed

| SECTION NUMBER | ACTION | CITE | EFFECTIVE DATE |
3 VAC 5-60-80 Amended 23:13 VA.R. 2138 5/19/07
3 VAC 5-60-100 Added 23:13 VA.R. 2139 5/19/07
3 VAC 5-70-100 Amended 23:13VAR. 2142 5/19/07
3 VAC 5-70-150 Amended 23:13 VAR. 2143 5/19/07
3 VAC 5-70-160 Amended 23:13 VA.R. 2143 5/19/07
3 VAC 5-70-230 Added 23:13 VAR. 2143 5/19/07
Title 4. Conservation and Natural Resources
4 VAC 20-70-100 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1958 2/1/07
4 VAC 20-200-10 Amended 23:11 VA.R. 1659 2/1/07
4 VAC 20-200-20 Amended 23:11 VA.R. 1659 2/1/07
4 VVAC 20-200-30 Amended 23:11 VA.R. 1659 2/1/07
4 VAC 20-200-40 Amended 23:11 VA.R. 1660 2/1/07
4 VVAC 20-200-50 Amended 23:11 VA.R. 1660 2/1/07
4 VAC 20-270-30 emer Amended 23:14 VA.R. 2276 3/1/07-3/30/07
4 VVAC 20-270-30 Amended 23:17 VAR. 2737 3/30/07
4 VAC 20-270-40 emer Amended 23:14 VA.R. 2276 3/1/07-3/30/07
4 VVAC 20-270-40 Amended 23:17 VAR. 2737 3/30/07
4 VVAC 20-300-20 emer Amended 23:14 VAR. 2277 3/1/07-3/30/07
4 VVAC 20-300-20 Amended 23:17 VA.R. 2738 3/30/07
4 VAC 20-310-55 Added 23:15 VAR. 2481 3/1/07
4 VVAC 20-370-10 through 4 VAC 20-370-30 Amended 23:19 VA.R. 2986 5/1/07
4 VAC 20-380-50 Amended 23:21 VA.R. 3446 10/1/07
4 VVAC 20-380-60 Amended 23:21 VAR. 3447 10/1/07
4 VAC 20-430-20 Amended 23:17 VA.R. 2738 3/30/07
4 VAC 20-430-45 Added 23:17 VA.R. 2738 3/30/07
4 VAC 20-450-30 Amended 23:17 VA.R. 2739 3/30/07
4 VAC 20-490-42 Amended 23:10 VA.R. 1540 12/21/06
4 VAC 20-490-42 Amended 23:19 VA.R. 2986 5/1/07
4 VAC 20-510-10 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1958 2/1/07
4 VAC 20-510-20 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1958 2/1/07
4 VAC 20-510-33 Added 23:12 VA.R. 1959 2/1/07
4 VAC 20-510-35 Added 23:12 VA.R. 1959 2/1/07
4 VAC 20-510-37 Added 23:12 VA.R. 1959 2/1/07
4 VAC 20-530-10 emer Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1959 2/1/07-3/1/07
4 VAC 20-530-20 emer Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1959 2/1/07-3/1/07
4 VAC 20-530-31 emer Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1960 2/1/07-3/1/07
4 VAC 20-530-31 Added 23:13 VAR. 2144 2/1/07-3/1/07
4 VAC 20-530-31 Amended 23:15 VAR. 2482 3/1/07
4 VAC 20-530-32 emer Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1960 2/1/07-3/1/07
4 VVAC 20-530-32 Added 23:13 VA.R. 2145 2/1/07-3/1/07
4 VAC 20-530-32 Amended 23:15 VAR. 2482 3/1/07
4 VAC 20-610-30 Amended 23:11 VA.R. 1660 2/1/07
4 VAC 20-610-60 Amended 23:11 VAR. 1662 2/1/07
4 VAC 20-620-50 Amended 23:15 VAR. 2483 3/1/07
4 VAC 20-620-60 Amended 23:15 VAR. 2483 3/1/07
4 VAC 20-620-70 Amended 23:15 VAR. 2483 3/1/07
4 VAC 20-670-15 Added 23:17 VAR. 2739 3/30/07
4 VVAC 20-670-30 Amended 23:17 VA.R. 2739 3/30/07
4 VAC 20-720-10 emer Amended 23:19 VA.R. 2987 5/1/07-5/30/07
4 VAC 20-720-10 Amended 23:21 VAR. 3447 5/23/07
4 VAC 20-720-20 emer Amended 23:19 VA.R. 2987 5/1/07-5/30/07

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007

4



Cumulative Table of VAC Sections Adopted, Amended, or Repealed

| SECTION NUMBER | ACTION | CITE | EFFECTIVEDATE |
4 VVAC 20-720-40 emer Amended 23:10 VA.R. 1540 1/1/07-1/30/07
4 VVAC 20-720-50 emer Amended 23:10 VA.R. 1541 1/1/07-1/30/07
4 VAC 20-720-60 emer Amended 23:19 VA.R. 2988 5/1/07-5/30/07
4 VAC 20-720-60 through 4 VAC 20-720-110 Amended 23:21 VA.R. 3447-3449 5/23/07
4 VAC 20-720-70 emer Amended 23:19 VA.R. 2989 5/1/07-5/30/07
4 VVAC 20-720-90 emer Amended 23:19 VA.R. 2989 5/1/07-5/30/07
4 VVAC 20-720-105 emer Added 23:19 VA.R. 2989 5/1/07-5/30/07
4 VAC 20-720-105 Added 23:21 VA.R. 3449 5/23/07
4 VAC 20-720-110 emer Amended 23:19 VA.R. 2990 5/1/07-5/30/07
4 VVAC 20-752-20 Amended 23:19 VA.R. 2990 5/3/07
4 VVAC 20-752-30 Amended 23:19 VA.R. 2991 5/3/07
4 VVAC 20-890-20 Amended 23:19 VA.R. 2991 7/1/07
4 VVAC 20-890-35 Amended 23:19 VA.R. 2991 7/1/07
4 VVAC 20-890-40 Amended 23:19 VA.R. 2991 7/1/07
4 VVAC 20-890-45 Added 23:19 VA.R. 2992 7/1/07
4 VVAC 20-900-25 Amended 23:19 VA.R. 2992 7/1/07
4 VAC 20-900-35 Amended 23:19 VA.R. 2993 7/1/07
4 VVAC 20-950-40 emer Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1961 2/1/07-3/1/07
4 VAC 20-950-40 Amended 23:15 VA.R. 2484 3/1/07
4 VVAC 20-950-47 emer Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1961 2/1/07-3/1/07
4 VAC 20-950-47 Amended 23:15 VA.R. 2484 3/1/07
4 VAC 20-950-47 Amended 23:17 VA.R. 2740 3/30/07
4 VVAC 20-950-48.2 emer Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1961 2/1/07-3/1/07
4 VAC 20-950-48.2 Amended 23:15 VA.R. 2484 3/1/07
4 VAC 20-950-48 Amended 23:17 VA.R. 2740 3/30/07
4 VAC 20-1090-30 Amended 23:11 VA.R. 1663 2/1/07
4 VAC 20-1110-10 through 4 VAC 20-1110-50 Added 23:19 VA.R. 2994 5/1/07
4 VAC 20-1120-10 through 4 VAC 20-1120-50 Added 23:19 VA.R. 2994-2995 5/1/07
4 VAC 20-1120-20 emer Amended 23:21 VA.R. 3449 5/29/07-6/28/07
4 VAC 20-1120-20 Amended 23:23 VAR. 3871 6/28/07
4 VAC 25-20 (Forms) Amended 23:24 VA.R. 3968 --
4 VAC 25-20-420 Amended 23:13 VA.R. 2146 4/4/07
4 VAC 25-50-10 through 4 VAC 25-50-110 Repealed 23:22 VA.R. 3696 8/8/07
4 VAC 25-130 (Forms) Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3370-3372 -
4 VAC 25-130-700.12 Amended 23:13 VA.R. 2146 4/4/07
4 VAC 25-130-773.21 Amended 23:13 VA.R. 2147 414107
4 VAC 25-130-775.11 Amended 23:13 VA.R. 2147 414107
4 VAC 25-130-775.13 Amended 23:13 VA.R. 2148 414107
4 VVAC 25-130-777.17 Amended 23:22 VA.R. 3696 8/8/07
4 VAC 25-130-784.20 Amended 23:13 VA.R. 2148 414107
4 VAC 25-130-785.25 Amended 23:16 VA.R. 2592 5/16/07
4 VAC 25-130-800.51 Amended 23:13 VA.R. 2149 414107
4 VAC 25-130-816.105 Amended 23:13 VA.R. 2150 414107
4 VAC 25-130-816.116 Amended 23:16 VA.R. 2592 5/16/07
4 VAC 25-130-817.11 Amended 23:13 VA.R. 2150 414107
4 VAC 25-130-817.64 Amended 23:13 VA.R. 2151 414107
4 VAC 25-130-817.116 Amended 23:16 VA.R. 2594 5/16/07
4 VAC 25-130-817.121 Amended 23:13 VA.R. 2151 414107
4 VAC 25-130-842.15 Amended 23:13 VA.R. 2153 4/4/07
4 VAC 25-130-843.12 Amended 23:13 VA.R. 2153 4/4/07
4 VAC 25-130-843.13 Amended 23:13 VA.R. 2154 4/4/07

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007

5



Cumulative Table of VAC Sections Adopted, Amended, or Repealed

| SECTION NUMBER | ACTION | CITE | EFFECTIVE DATE |
4 VAC 25-130-843.15 Amended 23:13 VAR. 2155 4/4/07
4 VAC 25-130-843.16 Amended 23:13 VAR. 2156 4/4/07
4 VAC 25-130-845.13 Amended 23:13 VAR. 2156 4/4/07
4 VAC 25-130-845.15 Amended 23:13 VA.R. 2158 4/4/07
4 VAC 25-130-845.18 Amended 23:13 VA.R. 2158 4/4/07
4 VAC 25-130-845.19 Amended 23:13 VAR. 2159 4/4/07
4 VAC 25-130-846.14 Amended 23:13 VA.R. 2159 4/4/07
Title 5. Corporations
5 VAC 5-30-10 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3872 7/1/07
5 VAC 5-30-20 Amended 23:23 VAR. 3872 7/1/07
5 VAC 5-30-30 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3873 7/1/07
5 VAC 5-30-40 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3873 7/1/07
5 VAC 5-30-50 Amended 23:23 VAR. 3874 7/1/07
5 VAC 5-30-60 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3874 7/1/07
5 VAC 5-30-70 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3875 7/1/07
Title 6. Criminal Justice and Corrections
6 VAC 15-20-10 through 6 VAC 15-20-230 Amended 23:22 VA.R. 3697-3703 8/9/07
6 VAC 20-120-40 Amended 23:25 VAR. 4177 9/19/07
6 VAC 35-20-37 emer Amended 23:25 VA.R. 4178 8/1/07-7/31/08
6 VAC 40-50-10 through 6\VAC40-50-80 emer Added 23:23 VA.R. 3876 7/1/06-12/29/07
Title 8. Education
8 VAC 20-21-10 through 8 VAC 20-21-730 Repealed 23:25 VA.R. 4179 9/21/07
8 VAC 20-22-10 through 8 VAC 20-22-760 Added 23:25 VAR. 4179-4214 9/21/07
8 VAC 20-160-10 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3876 8/27/07
8 VAC 20-160-20 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3878 8/27/07
8 VAC 20-160-30 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3878 8/27/07
8 VAC 20-160-40 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3879 8/27/07
8 VAC 20-160-50 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3879 8/27/07
8 VAC 20-160-60 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3879 8/27/07
8 VAC 20-350-10 through 8 VAC 20-350-660 Repealed 23:12VA.R. 1962 5/8/07
8 VAC 20-541-10 through 8 VAC 20-541-60 Repealed 23:25 VAR. 4214 9/21/07
8 VAC 20-542-10 through 8 VAC 20-542-600 Added 23:25 VA.R. 4214-4270 9/21/07
8 VAC 20-700-10 through 8 VAC 20-700-50 Added 23:10 VA.R. 1541-1543 2/21/07
8 VAC 20-710-10 through 8 VAC 20-710-30 Added 23:10 VA.R. 1543-1544 2/21/07
8 VAC 40-140-10 through 8 VAC 40-140-90 Added 23:22 VA.R. 3704-3706 7/1/07
Title 9. Environment
9 VAC 5-20-21 Amended 23:21 VA.R. 3456 8/1/07
9 VAC 5-30-15 Added 23:21 VAR. 3454 8/1/07
9 VAC 5-30-60 Amended 23:21 VAR. 3454 8/1/07
9 VAC 5-30-65 Amended 23:21 VAR. 3454 8/1/07
9 VAC 5-30-66 Added 23:21 VA.R. 3455 8/1/07
9 VAC 5-40-7550 through 9 VAC 5-40-7710 Added 23:21 VA.R. 3460-3463 8/1/07
9 VAC 5-50-400 Amended 23:17 VAR. 2742 6/1/07
9 VAC 5-50-410 Amended 23:17 VAR. 2742 6/1/07
9 VAC 5-60-60 Amended 23:17 VAR. 2747 6/1/07
9 VAC 5-60-90 Amended 23:17 VA.R. 2748 6/1/07
9 VAC 5-60-100 Amended 23:17 VA.R. 2748 6/1/07
9 VAC 5-140-1010 through 9 VAC 5-140-1060 Added 23:14 VAR. 2279-2291 4/18/07
9 VAC 5-140-1061 Added 23:14 VAR. 2291 *

Effective Date Suspended 23:19

Volume 24, Issue 1 Virginia Register of Regulations September 17, 2007
6




Cumulative Table of VAC Sections Adopted, Amended, or Repealed

| SECTION NUMBER | ACTION | CITE | EFFECTIVEDATE |
9 VAC 5-140-1062 Added 23:14 VAR. 2291 *
9 VAC 5-140-1070 through 9 VAC 5-140-1150 Added 23:14 VA.R. 2292-2295 4/18/07
9 VAC 5-140-1200 through 9 VAC 5-140-1240 Added 23:14 VA.R. 2295-2296 4/18/07
9 VAC 5-140-1400 through 9 VAC 5-140-1430 Added 23:14 VA.R. 2296-2302 4/18/07
9 VAC 5-140-1500 through 9 VAC 5-140-1570 Added 23:14 VA.R. 2302-2306 4/18/07
9 VAC 5-140-1600 through 9 VAC 5-140-1620 Added 23:14 VA.R. 2307 4/18/07
9 VAC 5-140-1700 through 9 VAC 5-140-1750 Added 23:14 VA.R. 2307-2312 4/18/07
9 VAC 5-140-1800 through 9 VAC 5-140-1880 Added 23:14 VAR. 2312-2317 4/18/07
9 VAC 5-140-2060 Added 23:14 VA.R. 2329 4/18/07
9 VAC 5-140-2061 Added 23:14 VAR. 2331 *
9 VAC 5-140-2062 Added 23:14 VAR. 2332 *
9 VAC 5-140-2070 Added 23:14 VAR. 2333 4/18/07
9 VAC 5-140-2080 Added 23:14 VAR. 2333 4/18/07
9 VAC 5-140-2100 through 9 VAC 5-140-2150 Added 23:14 VA.R. 2333-2336 4/18/07
9 VAC 5-140-2200 through 9 VAC 5-140-2240 Added 23:14 VA.R. 2336-2337 4/18/07
9 VAC 5-140-2400 through 9 VAC 5-140-2430 Added 23:14 VA.R. 2337-2342 4/18/07
9 VAC 5-140-2500 through 9 VAC 5-140-2570 Added 23:14 VA.R. 2342-2347 4/18/07
9 VAC 5-140-2600 through 9 VAC 5-140-2620 Added 23:14 VA.R. 2347 4/18/07
9 VAC 5-140-2700 through 9 VAC 5-140-2750 Added 23:14 VA.R. 2347-2353 4/18/07
9 VAC 5-140-2800 through 9 VAC 5-140-2880 Added 23:14 VA.R. 2353-2359 4/18/07
9 VAC 5-140-3010 through 9 VAC 5-140-3060 Added 23:14 VA.R. 2359-2368 4/18/07
9 VAC 5-140-3061 Added 23:14 VAR. 2370 *
9 VAC 5-140-3062 Added 23:14 VAR. 2371 *
9 VAC 5-140-3070 Added 23:14 VAR. 2371 4/18/07
9 VAC 5-140-3080 Added 23:14 VAR. 2371 4/18/07
9 VAC 5-140-3100 through 9 VAC 5-140-3150 Added 23:14 VA.R. 2371-2374 4/18/07
9 VAC 5-140-3200 through 9 VAC 5-140-3240 Added 23:14 VA.R. 2374-2375 4/18/07
9 VAC 5-140-3400 through 9 VAC 5-140-3420 Added 23:14 VA.R. 2375 4/18/07
9 VAC 5-140-3500 through 9 VAC 5-140-3570 Added 23:14 VA.R. 2375-2380 4/18/07
9 VAC 5-140-3600 through 9 VAC 5-140-3620 Added 23:14 VAR. 2380-2381 4/18/07
9 VAC 5-140-3700 through 9 VAC 5-140-3750 Added 23:14 VA R. 2381-2386 4/18/07
9 VAC 5-140-3800 through 9 VAC 5-140-3880 Added 23:14 VA R. 2386-2391 4/18/07
9 VAC 5-140-5010 through 9 VAC 5-140-5750 Added 23:13 VA.R. 2160-2186 4/4/07
9 VAC 5-140-1020 Erratum 23:16 VA.R. 2673 --
9 VAC 5-140-1061 Erratum 23:16 VA.R. 2673 --
9 VAC 5-140-1062 Erratum 23:16 VA.R. 2673 --
9 VAC 5-140-1130 Erratum 23:16 VA.R. 2673 --
9 VAC 5-140-1420 Erratum 23:16 VA.R. 2673 --
9 VAC 5-140-1700 Erratum 23:16 VA.R. 2673 --
9 VAC 5-140-1740 Erratum 23:16 VA.R. 2673 --
9 VAC 5-140-2020 Erratum 23:16 VA.R. 2673 --
9 VAC 5-140-2030 Erratum 23:16 VA.R. 2673 --
9 VAC 5-140-2040 Erratum 23:16 VA.R. 2673 --
9 VAC 5-140-2060 Erratum 23:16 VA.R. 2673 --
9 VAC 5-140-2062 Erratum 23:16 VA.R. 2673 --
9 VAC 5-140-2740 Erratum 23:16 VA.R. 2673 --
9 VAC 5-140-3062 Erratum 23:16 VA.R. 2673 --
9 VAC 5-140-3840 Erratum 23:16 VA.R. 2673 --
9 VAC 5-140-5020 Erratum 23:16 VA.R. 2672 --
9 VAC 5-140-5060 Erratum 23:16 VA.R. 2672 --
9 VAC 5-140-5100 Erratum 23:16 VA.R. 2672 --

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007

7



Cumulative Table of VAC Sections Adopted, Amended, or Repealed

| SECTION NUMBER | ACTION | CITE | EFFECTIVE DATE |
9 VAC 5-140-5150 Erratum 23:16 VA.R. 2672 --
9 VAC 5-140-5420 Erratum 23:16 VA.R. 2672 --
9 VAC 5-140-5510 Erratum 23:16 VA.R. 2672 --
9 VAC 5-140-5540 Erratum 23:16 VA.R. 2672 --
9 VAC 5-140-5560 Erratum 23:16 VA.R. 2672 --
9 VAC 5-140-5600 Erratum 23:16 VA.R. 2672 --
9 VAC 5-151-10 through 9 VAC 5-151-70 Added 23:17 VA.R. 2755-2764 5/31/07
9 VAC 5-240-10 through 9 VAC 5-240-50 Added 23:16 VA.R. 2595-2596 5/16/07
9 VAC 20-110-90 Amended 23:11 VA.R. 1665 3/21/07
9 VAC 20-110-110 Amended 23:11 VA.R. 1665 3/21/07
9 VAC 20-200-10 through 9 VAC 20-200-70 Added 23:11 VA.R. 1666-1667 3/21/07
9 VAC 25-71-20 Amended 23:15 VAR. 2485 5/2/07
9 VAC 25-71-50 Amended 23:15 VAR. 2485 5/2/07
9 VAC 25-71-70 Amended 23:15 VAR. 2485 5/2/07
9 VAC 25-210-10 Amended 23:21 VAR. 3464 7/25/07
9 VAC 25-210-50 Amended 23:21 VAR. 3468 7/25/07
9 VAC 25-210-60 Amended 23:21 VAR. 3469 7/25/07
9 VAC 25-210-75 Added 23:21 VAR. 3473 7/25/07
9 VAC 25-210-80 through 9 VAC 25-210-115 Amended 23:21 VA.R. 3474-3484 7/25/07
9 VAC 25-210-116 Added 23:21 VAR. 3484 7/25/07
9 VAC 25-210-130 Amended 23:21 VAR. 3487 7/25/07
9 VAC 25-210-140 Amended 23:21 VAR. 3488 7/25/07
9 VAC 25-210-170 Amended 23:21 VAR. 3489 7/25/07
9 VAC 25-210-175 Added 23:21 VA.R. 3489 7/25/07
9 VAC 25-210-180 Amended 23:21 VA.R. 3490 7/25/07
9 VAC 25-210-185 Amended 23:21 VA.R. 3492 7/25/07
9 VAC 25-210-190 Repealed 23:21 VA.R. 3492 7/25/07
9 VAC 25-210-200 Repealed 23:21 VA.R. 3493 7/25/07
9 VAC 25-210-210 Repealed 23:21 VA.R. 3493 7/25/07
9 VAC 25-210-220 Amended 23:21 VA.R. 3493 7/25/07
9 VAC 25-210-230 Amended 23:21 VA.R. 3493 7/25/07
9 VAC 25-210-260 Amended 23:21 VA.R. 3494 7/25/07
9 VAC 25-720-50 Amended 23:11 VA.R. 1669 3/21/07
9 VAC 25-720-50 Amended 23:15 VA.R. 2486 5/2/07
9 VAC 25-720-50 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3881 10/22/07
9 VAC 25-720-50 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3888 10/22/07
9 VAC 25-720-50 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3895 10/22/07
9 VAC 25-720-60 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1966 5/21/07
9 VAC 25-720-80 Amended 23:11 VA.R. 1670 3/21/07
9 VAC 25-720-80 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3901 10/22/07
9 VAC 25-720-90 Amended 23:11 VAR. 1671 3/21/07
9 VAC 25-720-100 Amended 23:11 VAR. 1671 3/21/07
9 VAC 25-720-130 Amended 23:15 VAR. 2487 5/2/07
Title 10. Finance and Financial Institutions
10 VAC 5-40-50 Added 23:18 VA.R. 2882 5/1/07
10 VAC 5-160-40 Amended 23:13 VAR. 2187 2/10/07
Title 11. Gaming
11 VAC 10-20-310 Amended 23:18 VA.R. 2883 5/31/07
11 VAC 10-20-330 Amended 23:18 VA.R. 2884 5/31/07
11 VAC 10-20-340 Amended 23:18 VAR. 2891 5/31/07
11 VAC 10-100-30 Amended 23:18 VA.R. 2892 5/31/07

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007

8



Cumulative Table of VAC Sections Adopted, Amended, or Repealed

| SECTION NUMBER | ACTION | CITE | EFFECTIVEDATE |
11 VAC 10-110-30 Amended 23:18 VA.R. 2893 5/31/07
11 VAC 10-110-90 Amended 23:18 VA.R. 2893 5/31/07
11 VAC 10-120-80 Amended 23:18 VA.R. 2894 5/31/07
11 VAC 10-130-10 Amended 23:11 VAR. 1672 1/10/07
11 VAC 10-130-10 Amended 23:18 VA.R. 2894 4/30/07
11 VAC 10-130-60 Amended 23:11 VAR. 1673 1/10/07
11 VAC 10-140-12 Added 23:18 VA.R. 2896 5/31/07
11 VAC 10-140-15 Added 23:18 VA.R. 2896 5/31/07
11 VAC 10-140-210 Amended 23:18 VA.R. 2896 5/31/07
11 VAC 10-150-12 Added 23:18 VA.R. 2897 5/31/07
11 VAC 10-150-15 Added 23:18 VA.R. 2897 5/31/07
11 VAC 10-180-10 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3164 5/18/07
11 VAC 10-180-20 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3164 5/18/07
11 VAC 10-180-60 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3166 5/18/07
11 VAC 10-180-80 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3167 5/18/07
Title 12. Health
12 VAC 5-70-10 through 12 VAC 5-70-50 Repealed 23:13 VA.R. 2187 414107
12 VAC 5-71-10 through 12 VAC 5-71-190 Added 23:13 VA.R. 2188-2195 414107
12 VAC 5-90 (Forms) Erratum 23:15 VA.R. 2507-2509 --
12 VAC 5-90-10 Amended 23:15 VA.R. 2488 5/2/07
12 VAC 5-90-40 Amended 23:15 VA.R. 2493 5/2/07
12 VAC 5-90-80 Amended 23:15 VA.R. 2493 5/2/07
12 VAC 5-90-90 Amended 23:15 VA.R. 2497 5/2/07
12 VAC 5-90-100 Amended 23:15 VA.R. 2500 5/2/07
12 VAC 5-90-103 Added 23:15 VA.R. 2500 5/2/07
12 VAC 5-90-107 Added 23:15 VA.R. 2502 5/2/07
12 VAC 5-90-110 Amended 23:15 VA.R. 2503 5/2/07
12 VAC 5-90-130 Amended 23:15 VA.R. 2504 5/2/07
12 VAC 5-90-225 Amended 23:15 VA.R. 2504 5/2/07
12 VAC 5-90-250 through 12 VAC 5-90-280 Amended 23:15 VA.R. 2505-2506 5/2/07
12 VAC 5-90-330 Amended 23:15 VA.R. 2506 5/2/07
12 VAC 5-90-350 Amended 23:15 VA.R. 2507 5/2/07
12 VAC 5-90-360 Amended 23:15 VA.R. 2507 5/2/07
12 VAC 5-125-10 Added 23:23 VA.R. 3904 9/1/07
12 VAC 5-125-20 Added 23:23 VA.R. 3906 9/1/07
12 VAC 5-125-30 Added 23:23 VA.R. 3906 9/1/07
12 VAC 5-125-40 Added 23:23 VA.R. 3906 9/1/07
12 VAC 5-125-50 Added 23:23 VA.R. 3907 9/1/07
12 VAC 5-125-60 Added 23:23 VA.R. 3908 9/1/07
12 VAC 5-125-70 Added 23:23 VA.R. 3908 9/1/07
12 VAC 5-125-80 Added 23:23 VA.R. 3908 9/1/07
12 VAC 5-125-90 Added 23:23 VA.R. 3908 9/1/07
12 VAC 5-125-100 Added 23:23 VA.R. 3916 9/1/07
12 VAC 5-125-110 Added 23:23 VA.R. 3917 9/1/07
12 VAC 5-125-120 Added 23:23 VA.R. 3917 9/1/07
12 VAC 5-125-130 Added 23:23 VA.R. 3917 9/1/07
12 VAC 5-125-140 Added 23:23 VA.R. 3918 9/1/07
12 VAC 5-125-150 Added 23:23 VA.R. 3918 9/1/07
12 VAC 5-125-160 Added 23:23 VA.R. 3918 9/1/07
12 VAC 5-125-170 Added 23:23 VA.R. 3918 9/1/07
12 VAC 5-125-180 Added 23:23 VA.R. 3919 9/1/07
Volume 24, Issue 1 Virginia Register of Regulations September 17, 2007

9



Cumulative Table of VAC Sections Adopted, Amended, or Repealed

| SECTION NUMBER | ACTION | CITE | EFFECTIVE DATE |
12 VAC 5-190-10 through 12 VAC 5-190-690 Repealed 23:21 VA.R. 3498 7/25/07
12 VAC 5-191-10 through 12 VAC 5-191-320 Added 23:21 VA.R. 3498-3509 7/25/07
12 VAC 5-371-10 Amended 23:10 VA.R. 1544 3/1/07
12 VAC 5-371-20 Repealed 23:10 VAR. 1546 3/1/07
12 VAC 5-371-30 Amended 23:10 VAR. 1547 3/1/07
12 VAC 5-371-40 Amended 23:10 VAR. 1547 3/1/07
12 VAC 5-371-50 Repealed 23:10 VAR. 1548 3/1/07
12 VAC 5-371-60 Amended 23:10 VAR. 1548 3/1/07
12 VAC 5-371-70 through 12 VAC 5-371-130 Amended 23:10 VAR. 1548-1551 3/1/07
12 VAC 5-371-150 Amended 23:10 VAR. 1551 3/1/07
12 VAC 5-371-160 Amended 23:10 VAR. 1551 3/1/07
12 VAC 5-371-190 Amended 23:10 VAR. 1551 3/1/07
12 VAC 5-371-200 Amended 23:10 VAR. 1552 3/1/07
12 VAC 5-371-400 Amended 23:10 VAR. 1552 3/1/07
12 VAC 5-371-410 Amended 23:10 VAR. 1552 3/1/07
12 VAC 5-410-10 Amended 23:10 VA.R. 1554 3/1/07
12 VAC 5-410-30 Amended 23:10 VAR. 1555 3/1/07
12 VAC 5-410-70 Amended 23:10 VAR. 1555 3/1/07
12 VAC 5-410-80 Amended 23:10 VAR. 1555 3/1/07
12 VAC 5-410-100 Amended 23:10 VAR. 1555 3/1/07
12 VAC 5-410-110 Amended 23:10 VAR. 1555 3/1/07
12 VAC 5-410-130 Amended 23:10 VAR. 1555 3/1/07
12 VAC 5-410-140 Amended 23:10 VAR. 1555 3/1/07
12 VAC 5-410-150 Amended 23:10 VA.R. 1556 3/1/07
12 VAC 5-410-180 Amended 23:10 VA.R. 1556 3/1/07
12 VAC 5-410-210 Amended 23:10 VA.R. 1556 3/1/07
12 VAC 5-410-220 Amended 23:10 VA.R. 1557 3/1/07
12 VAC 5-410-270 Amended 23:10 VA.R. 1558 3/1/07
12 VAC 5-410-442 Amended 23:10 VA.R. 1558 3/1/07
12 VAC 5-410-445 Amended 23:10 VA.R. 1559 3/1/07
12 VAC 5-410-650 Amended 23:10 VA.R. 1560 3/1/07
12 VAC 5-410-720 Amended 23:10 VA.R. 1560 3/1/07
12 VAC 5-410-760 Amended 23:10 VA.R. 1560 3/1/07
12 VAC 5-410-1150 Amended 23:10 VA.R. 1560 3/1/07
12 VAC 5-410-1170 Amended 23:10 VAR. 1561 3/1/07
12 VAC 5-410-1350 Amended 23:10 VAR. 1561 3/1/07
12 VAC 5-410-1380 Amended 23:10 VAR. 1561 3/1/07
12 VAC 5-585-760 through 12 VAC 5-585-830 Added 23:25 VAR. 4298-4301 10/1/07
12 VAC 30-10-140 Amended 23:16 VA.R. 2653 7/1/07
12 VAC 30-10-560 Amended 23:14 VAR. 2396 9/1/07
12 VAC 30-20-140 Amended 23:14 VAR. 2397 9/1/07
12 VAC 30-30-20 emer Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3169 5/30/07-5/29/08
12 VAC 30-30-60 Added 23:11 VAR. 1673 3/7/07
12 VAC 30-40-10 Amended 23:11 VAR. 1674 3/7/07
12 VAC 30-40-20 Amended 23:18 VA.R. 2897 7/1/07
12 VAC 30-40-105 emer Added 23:20 VAR. 3170 5/30/07-5/29/08
12 VAC 30-40-280 emer Amended 23:20 VAR. 3171 5/30/07-5/29/08
12 VAC 30-40-290 Amended 23:14 VAR. 2398 9/1/07
12 VAC 30-40-290 emer Amended 23:20 VAR. 3172 5/30/07-5/29/08
12 VAC 30-50-20 Amended 23:16 VA.R. 2654 7/1/07
12 VAC 30-50-35 Added 23:11 VA.R. 1675 3/7/07

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007

10



Cumulative Table of VAC Sections Adopted, Amended, or Repealed

| SECTION NUMBER | ACTION | CITE | EFFECTIVEDATE |

12 VAC 30-50-60 Amended 23:16 VA.R. 2654 7/1/07

12 VAC 30-50-75 Added 23:11 VA.R. 1676 3/7/07

12 VAC 30-50-130 Amended 23:21 VA.R. 3518 1/1/08

12 VAC 30-50-141 emer Added 23:21 VA.R. 3510 7/1/07-6/30/08
12 VAC 30-50-151 emer Added 23:21 VA.R. 3510 7/1/07-6/30/08
12 VAC 30-50-181 emer Added 23:21 VA.R. 3510 7/1/07-6/30/08
12 VAC 30-50-228 emer Added 23:21 VA.R. 3511 7/1/07-6/30/08
12 VAC 30-50-320 Amended 23:16 VA.R. 2654 7/1/07

12 VAC 30-50-321 Added 23:16 VA.R. 2655 7/1/07

12 VAC 30-50-325 Added 23:16 VA.R. 2655 7/1/07

12 VAC 30-50-328 Added 23:16 VA.R. 2655 7/1/07

12 VAC 30-50-461 emer Added 23:21 VA.R. 3512 7/1/07-6/30/08
12 VAC 30-50-490 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3175 7/11/07

12 VAC 30-50-530 Amended 23:11 VA.R. 1676 3/7/07

12 VAC 30-60-250 emer Added 23:21 VA.R. 3513 7/1/07-6/30/08
12 VAC 30-60-255 emer Added 23:21 VA.R. 3515 7/1/07-6/30/08
12 VAC 30-60-500 emer Added 23:26 VA.R. 4427 8/8/07-8/7/08
12 VAC 30-70-311 Amended 23:19 VA.R. 3003 7/1/07

12 VAC 30-70-321 Amended 23:19 VA.R. 3003 7/1/07

12 VAC 30-70-331 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3225 8/25/07

12 VAC 30-70-341 Amended 23:19 VA.R. 3003 7/1/07

12 VAC 30-70-391 Amended 23:19 VA.R. 3004 7/1/07

12 VAC 30-80-30 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3232 7/11/07

12 VAC 30-80-32 emer Added 23:21 VA.R. 3516 7/1/07-6/30/08
12 VAC 30-80-95 Added 23:21 VA.R. 3520 1/1/08

12 VAC 30-80-190 Amended 23:19 VA.R. 3004 7/1/07

12 VAC 30-80-190 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3225 8/25/07

12 VAC 30-80-190 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3242 7/11/07

12 VAC 30-90-31 Amended 23:19 VA.R. 3005 7/1/07

12 VAC 30-90-41 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3226 8/25/07

12 VAC 30-90-271 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3229 8/25/07

12 VAC 30-90-290 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3230 8/25/07

12 VAC 30-90-264 Amended 23:14 VA.R. 2400 4/18/07

12 VAC 30-110-950 Amended 23:18 VA.R. 2898 7/1/07

12 VAC 30-120 Erratum 23:24 VA.R. 4080 --

12 VAC 30-120-61 Amended 23:16 VA.R. 2655 7/1/07

12 VAC 30-120-62 Amended 23:16 VA.R. 2657 7/1/07

12 VAC 30-120-64 Amended 23:16 VA.R. 2659 7/1/07

12 VAC 30-120-65 Amended 23:16 VA.R. 2660 7/1/07

12 VAC 30-120-66 Amended 23:16 VA.R. 2660 7/1/07

12 VAC 30-120-68 Amended 23:16 VA.R. 2661 7/1/07

12 VAC 30-120-310 emer Amended 23:21 VA.R. 3516 7/1/07-6/30/08
12 VAC 30-120-370 emer Amended 23:24 VA.R. 4029 9/1/07-8/31/08
12 VAC 30-120-380 emer Amended 23:21 VA.R. 3517 7/1/07-6/30/08
12 VAC 30-120-380 emer Amended 23:24 VA.R. 4032 9/1/07-8/31/08
12 VAC 30-120-700 through 12 VAC 30-120-750 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3177-3192 7/11/07

12 VAC 30-120-752 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3192 7/11/07

12 VAC 30-120-753 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3194 7/11/07

12 VAC 30-120-754 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3195 7/11/07

12 VAC 30-120-756 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3197 7/11/07

12 VAC 30-120-758 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3198 7/11/07

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007

11



Cumulative Table of VAC Sections Adopted, Amended, or Repealed

| SECTION NUMBER | ACTION | CITE | EFFECTIVE DATE |
12 VAC 30-120-760 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3198 7/11/07
12 VAC 30-120-762 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3199 7/11/07
12 VAC 30-120-764 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3199 7/11/07
12 VAC 30-120-766 Amended 23:20 VAR. 3201 7/11/07
12 VAC 30-120-768 Repealed 23:20 VAR. 3204 7/11/07
12 VAC 30-120-770 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3206 7/11/07
12 VAC 30-120-772 Amended 23:20 VAR. 3211 7/11/07
12 VAC 30-120-774 Amended 23:20 VAR. 3211 7/11/07
12 VAC 30-120-776 Amended 23:20 VAR. 3213 7/11/07
12 VAC 30-120-780 Repealed 23:20 VAR. 3215 7/11/07
12 VAC 30-120-790 Repealed 23:20 VAR. 3216 7/11/07
12 VAC 30-120-1600 through 12 VAC 30-120-1660  Added 23:20 VA.R. 3244-3251 7/11/07
12 VAC 30-130-900 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1967 3/21/07
12 VAC 30-130-910 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1968 3/21/07
12 VAC 30-130-930 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1968 3/21/07
12 VAC 30-135-10 through 12 VAC 30-135-40 Amended 23:21 VA.R. 3520-3522 11/1/07
12 VAC 30-135-80 Amended 23:21 VAR. 3522 11/1/07
12 VAC 30-141-740 Amended 23:19 VA.R. 3006 7/1/07
12 VAC 35-45-10 Amended 23:10 VA.R. 1562 2/21/07
12 VAC 35-45-25 Added 23:10 VA.R. 1565 2/21/07
12 VAC 35-45-70 Amended 23:10 VA.R. 1564 2/21/07
12 VAC 35-45-80 Amended 23:10 VA.R. 1564 2/21/07
12 VAC 35-45-210 Added 23:10 VAR. 1564 2/21/07
12 VAC 35-105-20 Amended 23:10 VA.R. 1567 2/21/07
12 VAC 35-105-30 Amended 23:10 VA.R. 1575 2/21/07
12 VAC 35-105-115 emer Added 23:10 VA.R. 1566 1/3/07-1/2/08
12 VAC 35-105-590 Amended 23:10 VA.R. 1575 2/21/07
12 VAC 35-105-660 Amended 23:10 VA.R. 1576 2/21/07
12 VAC 35-105-925 Added 23:20 VA.R. 3252 7/11/07
12 VAC 35-115-10 through 12 VAC 35-115-250 Amended 23:25 VA.R. 4301-4340 9/19/07
12 VAC 35-115-145 Added 23:25 VAR. 4329 9/19/07
12 VAC 35-115-146 Added 23:25 VAR. 4330 9/19/07
12 VAC 35-115-160 Repealed 23:25 VAR. 4332 9/19/07
12 VAC 35-210-10 through 12 VAC 35-210-120 Added 23:21 VA.R. 3525-3529 7/25/07
Title 13. Housing
13 VAC 5-31 Erratum 23:24 VAR. 4079 --
13 VAC 5-91 Erratum 23:24 VA.R. 4080 --
13 VAC 5-111-10 through 13 VAC 5-111-400 Repealed 23:12 VAR. 1971 3/21/07
13 VAC 5-112-10 through 13 VAC 5-112-560 Added 23:12 VA.R. 1971-1994 3/21/07
Title 14. Insurance
14 VAC 5-200-20 Repealed 23:17 VAR. 2766 9/1/07
14 VAC 5-200-30 through 14 VAC 5-200-60 Amended 23:17 VAR. 2766-2770 9/1/07
14 VAC 5-200-70 through 14 VAC 5-200-90 Amended 23:17 VA.R. 2770-2774 9/1/07
14 VAC 5-200-110 Amended 23:17 VAR. 2774 9/1/07
14 VAC 5-200-120 Amended 23:17 VAR. 2777 9/1/07
14 VAC 5-200-153 Amended 23:17 VAR. 2777 9/1/07
14 VAC 5-200-170 Amended 23:17 VAR. 2780 9/1/07
14 VAC 5-200-175 Amended 23:17 VA.R. 2781 9/1/07
14 VAC 5-200-181 Added 23:17 VAR. 2782 9/1/07
14 VAC 5-200-183 Added 23:17 VAR. 2782 9/1/07
14 VAC 5-200-185 Amended 23:17 VA.R. 2783 9/1/07

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007

12



Cumulative Table of VAC Sections Adopted, Amended, or Repealed

| SECTION NUMBER | ACTION | CITE | EFFECTIVE DATE |
14 VAC 5-200-187 Amended 23:17 VA.R. 2785 9/1/07
14 VAC 5-200-200 Amended 23:17 VA.R. 2786 9/1/07
14 VAC 5-200-201 Added 23:17 VA.R. 2788 9/1/07
14 VAC 5-200-205 Added 23:17 VA.R. 2788 9/1/07
14 VAC 5-215-20 Amended 23:22 VA.R. 3768 7/1/07
14 VAC 5-215-30 Amended 23:22 VA.R. 3768 7/1/07
14 VAC 5-215-50 Amended 23:22 VA.R. 3769 7/1/07
14 VAC 5-215-60 Amended 23:22 VAR. 3770 7/1/07
14 VAC 5-215-80 Amended 23:22 VAR. 3770 7/1/07
14 VAC 5-321-10 Amended 23:10 VAR. 1577 1/1/07
14 VAC 5-321-20 Amended 23:10 VAR. 1577 1/1/07
14 VAC 5-321-30 Amended 23:10 VAR. 1578 1/1/07
14 VAC 5-321-70 Added 23:10 VAR. 1578 1/1/07
14 VAC 5-322-10 through 14 VAC 5-322-50 Added 23:10 VAR. 1579-1581 1/1/07
Title 16. Labor and Employment
16 VAC 15-21-30 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3933 8/23/07
16 VAC 25-55-10 and 16 VAC 25-55-20 Added 23:12 VAR. 1995-1996 3/22/07
16 VAC 25-75-10 Added 23:21 VAR. 3544 7/26/07
16 VAC 25-90-1910.268 (b) (7) Repealed 23:21 VA.R. 3545 7/26/07
16 VAC 25-90-1910.134 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1997 3/21/07
16 VAC 25-90-1910.1000 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1996 3/21/07
16 VAC 25-90-1910.1001 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1997 3/21/07
16 VAC 25-90-1910.1017 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1997 3/21/07
16 VAC 25-90-1910.1018 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1997 3/21/07
16 VAC 25-90-1910.1025 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1997 3/21/07
16 VAC 25-90-1910.1027 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1997 3/21/07
16 VAC 25-90-1910.1028 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1997 3/21/07
16 VAC 25-90-1910.1029 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1997 3/21/07
16 VAC 25-90-1910.1043 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1997 3/21/07
16 VAC 25-90-1910.1044 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1997 3/21/07
16 VAC 25-90-1910.1045 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1997 3/21/07
16 VAC 25-90-1910.1047 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1997 3/21/07
16 VAC 25-90-1910.1048 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1997 3/21/07
16 VAC 25-90-1910.1050 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1997 3/21/07
16 VAC 25-90-1910.1052 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1997 3/21/07
16 VAC 25-100-1915.5 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1998 3/21/07
16 VAC 25-100-1915.505 Amended 23:12 VAR. 1998 3/21/07
16 VAC 25-100-1915.507 Amended 23:12 VAR. 1998 3/21/07
16 VAC 25-100-1915.1000 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1996 3/21/07
16 VAC 25-100-1915.1001 Amended 23:12 VAR. 1997 3/21/07
16 VAC 25-175-1926.55 Added 23:12 VAR. 1996 3/21/07
16 VAC 25-175-1926.60 Amended 23:12 VAR. 1997 3/21/07
16 VAC 25-175-1926.62 Amended 23:12 VAR. 1997 3/21/07
16 VAC 25-175-1926.1002, Appendix A of Subpart W Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1999 3/21/07
16 VAC 25-175-1926.1101 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1997 3/21/07
16 VAC 25-175-1926.1127 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1997 3/21/07
16 VAC 25-190-1928.52 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1999 3/21/07
16 VAC 25-190-1928.53, Appendix B to Subpart C Amended 23:12 VA.R. 1999 3/21/07
Title 18. Professional and Occupational Licensing
18 VAC 5-10-10 through 18 VAC 5-10-90 Amended 23:11 VAR. 1678-1680 4/23/07
18 VAC 10-20-230 Amended 23:21 VAR. 3548 9/10/07
Volume 24, Issue 1 Virginia Register of Regulations September 17, 2007

13



Cumulative Table of VAC Sections Adopted, Amended, or Repealed

| SECTION NUMBER | ACTION | CITE | EFFECTIVE DATE |

18 VAC 10-20-420 Amended 23:21 VA.R. 3550 8/1/07
18 VAC 10-20-440 Amended 23:21 VA.R. 3551 8/1/07
18 VAC 10-20-450 Amended 23:21 VA.R. 3551 8/1/07
18 VAC 15-20 (Forms) Added 23:15 VAR. 2514 --

18 VAC 15-30 (Forms) Amended 23:15 VAR. 2514 --

18 VAC 25-21-80 Amended 23:21 VAR. 3557 8/1/07
18 VAC 25-21-90 Amended 23:21 VAR. 3558 8/1/07
18 VAC 25-21-180 Amended 23:21 VAR. 3558 8/1/07
18 VAC 25-21-230 through 18 VAC 25-21-280 Added 23:21 VA.R. 3559-3560 8/1/07
18 VAC 30-10-10 through 18 VAC 30-10-80 Amended 23:20 VAR. 3276-3277 8/25/07
18 VAC 30-10-100 Amended 23:20 VAR. 3277 8/25/07
18 VAC 30-10-110 Amended 23:20 VAR. 3277 8/25/07
18 VAC 30-10-120 Amended 23:20 VAR. 3277 8/25/07
18 VAC 41-60-10 through 18 VAC 41-60-220 Added 23:12 VA.R. 2000-2009 4/1/07
18 VAC 41-70-10 through 18 VAC 41-70-280 Added 23:25 VA.R. 4349-4359 9/20/07
18 VAC 45-20-40 Amended 23:21 VAR. 3562 9/10/07
18 VAC 47-20-10 Amended 23:21 VAR. 3563 8/1/07
18 VAC 47-20-35 Added 23:21 VAR. 3564 8/1/07
18 VAC 47-20-210 Amended 23:21 VAR. 3564 8/1/07
18 VAC 47-20-240 Repealed 23:21 VAR. 3564 8/1/07
18 VAC 47-20-250 Added 23:21 VAR. 3564 8/1/07
18 VAC 47-20-260 Added 23:21 VA.R. 3565 8/1/07
18 VAC 47-20-270 Added 23:21 VA.R. 3565 8/1/07
18 VAC 50-30-10 through 18 VAC 50-30-50 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 2020-2025 4/1/07
18 VAC 50-30-60 Repealed 23:12 VA.R. 2025 4/1/07
18 VAC 50-30-70 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 2025 4/1/07
18 VAC 50-30-80 Repealed 23:12 VA.R. 2025 4/1/07
18 VAC 50-30-90 through 18 VAC 50-30-150 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 2026-2028 4/1/07
18 VAC 50-30-180 Repealed 23:12 VA.R. 2028 4/1/07
18 VAC 50-30-185 Added 23:12 VA.R. 2028 4/1/07
18 VAC 50-30-190 Amended 23:12 VAR. 2028 4/1/07
18 VAC 50-30-200 Amended 23:12 VAR. 2029 4/1/07
18 VAC 50-30-210 through 18 VAC 50-30-260 Added 23:12 VAR. 2030-2031 4/1/07
18 VAC 60-10-10 through 18 VAC 60-10-80 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3283-3284 8/25/07
18 VAC 60-10-100 Amended 23:20 VAR. 3284 8/25/07
18 VAC 60-10-110 Amended 23:20 VAR. 3284 8/25/07
18 VAC 60-10-120 Amended 23:20 VAR. 3284 8/25/07
18 VAC 60-20-71 Amended 23:23 VAR. 3934 8/22/07
18 VAC 60-20-180 Amended 23:15 VAR. 2510 5/2/07
18 VAC 60-20-210 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3286 8/25/07
18 VAC 65-40-10 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 2031 3/21/07
18 VAC 65-40-40 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 2031 3/21/07
18 VAC 65-40-90 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 2032 3/21/07
18 VAC 65-40-110 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 2032 3/21/07
18 VAC 65-40-130 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 2032 3/21/07
18 VAC 65-40-160 Repealed 23:12 VA.R. 2032 3/21/07
18 VAC 65-40-220 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 2032 3/21/07
18 VAC 65-40-250 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 2032 3/21/07
18 VAC 65-40-300 Repealed 23:12 VA.R. 2032 3/21/07
18 VAC 65-40-320 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 2033 3/21/07
18 VAC 65-40-340 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 2033 3/21/07

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007

14



Cumulative Table of VAC Sections Adopted, Amended, or Repealed

| SECTION NUMBER | ACTION | CITE | EFFECTIVEDATE |

18 VAC 75-10-10 through 18 VAC 75-10-80 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3288-3290 8/25/07
18 VAC 75-10-100 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3290 8/25/07
18 VAC 75-10-110 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3290 8/25/07
18 VAC 75-10-120 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3290 8/25/07
18 VAC 75-20-60 Amended 23:21 VA.R. 3574 9/10/07
18 VAC 75-20-70 Amended 23:21 VA.R. 3575 9/10/07
18 VAC 75-20-120 Added 23:21 VAR. 3575 9/10/07
18 VAC 75-20-130 Added 23:21 VAR. 3575 9/10/07
18 VAC 75-20-140 Added 23:21 VAR. 3575 9/10/07
18 VAC 76-30-10 through 18 VAC 76-30-80 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3292-3294 8/25/07
18 VAC 76-30-100 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3294 8/25/07
18 VAC 76-30-110 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3294 8/25/07
18 VAC 76-30-120 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3294 8/25/07
18 VAC 85-10 through 18 VAC 85-10-70 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3296-3297 8/25/07
18 VAC 85-10-90 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3297 8/25/07
18 VAC 85-10-100 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3297 8/25/07
18 VAC 85-10-110 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3298 8/25/07
18 VAC 85-20-30 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3299 8/25/07
18 VAC 85-20-235 Amended 23:11 VA.R. 1692 4/21/07
18 VAC 85-20-235 Amended 23:25 VA.R. 4360 9/20/07
18 VAC 85-20-235 Amended 23:25 VA.R. 4361 9/20/07
18 VAC 85-20-290 Amended 23:13 VA.R. 2206 414107
18 VAC 85-20-290 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3934 8/22/07
18 VAC 85-20-400 through 18 VAC 85-20-420 Adding 23:25 VA.R. 4362-4363 9/20/07
18 VAC 85-101-50 Amended 23:15 VA.R. 2511 5/2/07
18 VAC 85-130-10 through 18 VAC 85-130-170 Added 23:10 VA.R. 1582-1586 2/21/07
18 VAC 90-10-10 through 18 VAC 90-10-80 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3307-3309 8/25/07
18 VAC 90-10-100 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3309 8/25/07
18 VAC 90-10-110 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3309 8/25/07
18 VAC 90-10-120 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3309 8/25/07
18 VAC 90-20-30 Amended 23:25 VA.R. 4363 10/1/07
18 VAC 90-20-60 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 2033 3/21/07
18 VAC 90-20-225 Added 23:25 VA.R. 4364 10/1/07
18 VAC 90-25-15 through 18 VAC 90-25-80 Amended 23:21 VA.R. 3576-3581 7/25/07
18 VAC 90-25-71 Added 23:21 VA.R. 3580 7/25/07
18 VAC 90-25-72 Added 23:21 VA.R. 3580 7/25/07
18 VAC 90-25-81 Added 23:21 VA.R. 3581 7/25/07
18 VAC 90-25-100 through 18 VAC 90-25-130 Amended 23:21 VA.R. 3581-3583 7/25/07
18 VAC 90-30-120 Amended 23:14 VA.R. 2404 4/18/07
18 VAC 90-30-230 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 2034 3/21/07
18 VAC 90-40-140 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 2034 3/21/07
18 VAC 90-60-10 through 18 VVAC 90-60-120 Added 23:19 VA.R. 3008-3012 7/1/07
18 VAC 90-60-120 Erratum 23:20 VA.R. 3378 --

18 VAC 105-10-10 through 18 VAC 105-10-80 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3315-3316 8/25/07
18 VAC 105-10-100 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3316 8/25/07
18 VAC 105-10-110 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3316 8/25/07
18 VAC 105-10-120 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3316 8/25/07
18 VAC 105-20-10 Amended 23:22 VA.R. 3791 9/24/07
18 VAC 110-10-10 through 18 VAC 110-10-80 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3318-3320 8/25/07
18 VAC 110-10-100 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3320 8/25/07
18 VAC 110-10-110 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3320 8/25/07

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007

15



Cumulative Table of VAC Sections Adopted, Amended, or Repealed

| SECTION NUMBER | ACTION | CITE | EFFECTIVE DATE |
18 VAC 110-10-120 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3320 8/25/07
18 VAC 110-20-285 Amended 23:17 VA.R. 2791 5/30/07
18 VAC 112-10-10 through 18 VAC 112-10-80 Amended 23:20 VA R. 3327-3329 8/25/07
18 VAC 112-10-100 Amended 23:20 VAR. 3329 8/25/07
18 VAC 112-10-110 Amended 23:20 VAR. 3329 8/25/07
18 VAC 112-10-120 Amended 23:20 VAR. 3329 8/25/07
18 VAC 115-10-10 through 18 VAC 115-10-80 Amended 23:20 VA R. 3331-3332 8/25/07
18 VAC 115-10-100 Amended 23:20 VAR. 3332 8/25/07
18 VAC 115-10-110 Amended 23:20 VAR. 3333 8/25/07
18 VAC 115-10-120 Amended 23:20 VAR. 3333 8/25/07
18 VAC 115-20-20 Amended 23:14 VAR. 2404 4/18/07
18 VAC 115-20-130 Amended 23:21 VAR. 3584 7/25/07
18 VAC 115-30-30 Amended 23:14 VAR. 2405 4/18/07
18 VAC 115-40-20 Amended 23:14 VAR. 2405 4/18/07
18 VAC 115-50-20 Amended 23:14 VAR. 2405 4/18/07
18 VAC 115-50-110 Amended 23:21 VAR. 3585 7/25/07
18 VAC 115-60-20 Amended 23:14 VA.R. 2406 4/18/07
18 VAC 115-60-130 Amended 23:21 VAR. 3587 7/25/07
18 VAC 120-30-10 Amended 23:21 VAR. 3589 8/1/07
18 VAC 120-30-30 Amended 23:21 VA.R. 3590 8/1/07
18 VAC 120-30-40 Amended 23:21 VA.R. 3590 8/1/07
18 VAC 120-30-50 Amended 23:21 VAR. 3591 8/1/07
18 VAC 120-30-55 Added 23:21 VAR. 3591 8/1/07
18 VAC 120-30-90 Repealed 23:21 VA.R. 3592 8/1/07
18 VAC 120-30-100 Amended 23:21 VAR. 3588 8/1/07
18 VAC 120-30-100 Amended 23:21 VA.R. 3592 8/1/07
18 VAC 120-30-130 Amended 23:21 VA.R. 3592 8/1/07
18 VAC 120-30-150 Amended 23:21 VA.R. 3592 8/1/07
18 VAC 120-30-160 Amended 23:21 VA.R. 3592 8/1/07
18 VAC 120-30-180 Amended 23:21 VA.R. 3592 8/1/07
18 VAC 120-30-190 Amended 23:21 VAR. 3593 8/1/07
18 VAC 120-30-200 Amended 23:21 VAR. 3593 8/1/07
18 VAC 120-30-220 Amended 23:21 VAR. 3593 8/1/07
18 VAC 120-30-230 Amended 23:21 VA.R. 3594 8/1/07
18 VAC 120-30-240 Amended 23:21 VAR. 3594 8/1/07
18 VAC 120-30-250 Amended 23:21 VA.R. 3594 8/1/07
18 VAC 120-30-270 Amended 23:21 VAR. 3594 8/1/07
18 VAC 120-30-280 Amended 23:21 VAR. 3595 8/1/07
18 VAC 120-30-290 Added 23:21 VAR. 3595 8/1/07
18 VAC 120-30-300 Added 23:21 VAR. 3595 8/1/07
18 VAC 120-30-310 Added 23:21 VAR. 3595 8/1/07
18 VAC 120-40-10 Amended 23:24 VAR. 4038 9/5/07
18 VAC 120-40-15 Added 23:24 VAR. 4039 9/5/07
18 VAC 120-40-20 Amended 23:24 VAR. 4039 9/5/07
18 VAC 120-40-80 through 18VAC120-40-360 Amended 23:24 VA R. 4040-4052 9/5/07
18 VAC 120-40-221 Added 23:24 VAR. 4043 9/5/07
18 VAC 120-40-222 Added 23:24 VAR. 4043 9/5/07
18 VAC 120-40-295 Added 23:24 VAR. 4048 9/5/07
18 VAC 120-40-342 Added 23:24 VA.R. 4050 9/5/07
18 VAC 120-40-370 Repealed 23:24 VAR. 4052 9/5/07
18 VAC 120-40-380 Repealed 23:24 VAR. 4052 9/5/07

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007

16



Cumulative Table of VAC Sections Adopted, Amended, or Repealed

| SECTION NUMBER | ACTION | CITE | EFFECTIVEDATE |
18 VAC 120-40-385 Added 23:24 VA.R. 4052 9/5/07
18 VAC 120-40-390 Amended 23:24 VA.R. 4053 9/5/07
18 VAC 120-40-400 Repealed 23:24 VA.R. 4053 9/5/07
18 VAC 120-40-410 Amended 23:24 VA.R. 4053 9/5/07
18 VAC 120-40-411 Added 23:24 VA.R. 4053 9/5/07
18 VAC 120-40-411.1 through 18VAC120-40-411.21  Added 23:24 VA.R. 4054-4064 9/5/07
18 VAC 120-40-415 Added 23:24 VA.R. 4064 9/5/07
18 VAC 120-40-415.1 Added 23:24 VA.R. 4065 9/5/07
18 VAC 120-40-415.2 Added 23:24 VA.R. 4065 9/5/07
18 VAC 120-40-415.3 Added 23:24 VA.R. 4065 9/5/07
18 VAC 120-40-420 Amended 23:24 VA.R. 4066 9/5/07
18 VAC 120-40-430 Amended 23:24 VA.R. 4066 9/5/07
18 VAC 125-10-10 through 18 VAC 125-10-80 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3346-3348 8/25/07
18 VAC 125-10-100 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3348 8/25/07
18 VAC 125-10-110 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3348 8/25/07
18 VAC 125-10-120 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3348 8/25/07
18 VAC 125-20-30 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 2035 3/21/07
18 VAC 125-30-20 Amended 23:12 VA.R. 2035 3/21/07
18 VAC 135-50-10 Amended 23:22 VA.R. 3794 9/22/07
18 VAC 135-50-20 Amended 23:22 VA.R. 3795 9/22/07
18 VAC 135-50-220 Amended 23:22 VA.R. 3795 9/22/07
18 VAC 135-50-400 Amended 23:22 VA.R. 3795 9/22/07
18 VAC 140-10-10 through 18 VAC 140-10-80 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3350-3351 8/25/07
18 VAC 140-10-100 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3351 8/25/07
18 VAC 140-10-110 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3352 8/25/07
18 VAC 140-10-120 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3352 8/25/07
18 VAC 145-30-40 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3352 7/12/07
18 VAC 150-10-10 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3937 10/7/07
18 VAC 150-10-20 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3937 10/7/07
18 VAC 150-10-30 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3937 10/7/07
18 VAC 150-10-40 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3938 10/7/07
18 VAC 150-10-50 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3938 10/7/07
18 VAC 150-10-60 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3938 10/7/07
18 VAC 150-10-70 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3938 10/7/07
18 VAC 150-10-80 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3938 10/7/07
18 VAC 150-10-100 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3939 10/7/07
18 VAC 150-10-110 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3939 10/7/07
18 VAC 150-10-120 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3939 10/7/07
Title 19. Public Safety
19 VAC 30-20-80 Amended 23:10 VA.R. 1587 3/1/07
Title 21. Securities and Retail Franchising
21 VAC 5-10 Erratum 23:18 VA.R. 2935 --
21 VAC 5-10-40 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3940 7/1/07
21 VAC 5-20 Erratum 23:18 VA.R. 2935 --
21 VAC 5-20-65 Added 23:23 VA.R. 3942 7/1/07
21 VAC 5-20-95 Added 23:23 VA.R. 3942 7/1/07
21 VAC 5-20-280 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3943 7/1/07
21 VAC 5-20-330 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3947 7/1/07
21 VAC 5-80-65 Added 23:23 VA.R. 3949 7/1/07
21 VAC 5-80-160 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3950 7/1/07
21 VAC 5-80-200 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3954 7/1/07

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007

17



Cumulative Table of VAC Sections Adopted, Amended, or Repealed

| SECTION NUMBER | ACTION | CITE | EFFECTIVE DATE |
21 VAC 5-110 Erratum 23:18 VA.R. 2935 -
21 VAC 5-110 Erratum 23:24 VA.R. 4079 --
21 VAC 5-110-65 Added 23:23 VA.R. 3959 7/1/07
21 VAC 5-110-75 Added 23:23 VA.R. 3960 7/1/07
Title 22. Social Services
22 VAC 15-10-40 Amended 23:10 VAR. 1587 3/1/07
22 VAC 15-10-50 Amended 23:10 VAR. 1587 3/1/07
22 VAC 15-30-10 Amended 23:20 VAR. 3353 7/11/07
22 VAC 15-30-310 Amended 23:20 VAR. 3356 7/11/07
22 VAC 15-30-580 Amended 23:20 VAR. 3358 7/11/07
22 VAC 40-20-10 Repealed 23:20 VA.R. 3364 8/1/07
22 VAC 40-25-10 through 22 VAC 40-25-70 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3360-3364 8/1/07
22 VAC 40-25-45 Added 23:20 VA.R. 3363 8/1/07
22 VAC 40-35-10 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3962 9/1/07
22 VAC 40-35-80 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3965 9/1/07
22 VAC 40-35-90 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3965 9/1/07
22 VAC 40-35-100 Amended 23:23 VA.R. 3966 9/1/07
22 VAC 40-41-10 through 22 VAC 40-41-50 Amended 23:22 VA.R. 3796-3799 9/1/07
22 VAC 40-41-55 Amended 23:22 VA.R. 3799 9/1/07
22 VAC 40-41-60 Amended 23:22 VA.R. 3799 9/1/07
22 VAC 40-540-10 Repealed 23:20 VA.R. 3364 8/1/07
22 VAC 40-600-10 through 22 VAC 40-600-240 Repealed 23:20 VA.R. 3364 8/1/07
22 VAC 40-601-10 through 22 VAC 40-601-40 Added 23:20 VA.R. 3365-3366 8/1/07
22 VAC 40-740-10 Amended 23:10 VA.R. 1588 3/1/07
22 VAC 40-740-15 Added 23:10 VA.R. 1591 3/1/07
22 VAC 40-740-20 Repealed 23:10 VA.R. 1592 3/1/07
22 VAC 40-740-21 Added 23:10 VA.R. 1592 3/1/07
22 VAC 40-740-30 Repealed 23:10 VA.R. 1593 3/1/07
22 VAC 40-740-31 Added 23:10 VA.R. 1593 3/1/07
22 VAC 40-740-40 Amended 23:10 VA.R. 1593 3/1/07
22 VAC 40-740-50 Amended 23:10 VAR. 1594 3/1/07
22 VAC 40-740-60 Amended 23:10 VAR. 1595 3/1/07
22 VAC 40-740-70 Added 23:10 VAR. 1596 3/1/07
22 VAC 40-740-80 Added 23:10 VAR. 1596 3/1/07
22 VAC 40-880-200 Amended 23:20 VAR. 3367 8/1/07
22 VAC 40-880-250 Amended 23:20 VAR. 3367 8/1/07
22 VAC 40-880-270 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3367 8/1/07
22 VAC 40-880-350 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3368 8/1/07
22 VAC 40-880-620 Amended 23:20 VA.R. 3369 8/1/07
Title 23. Taxation
23 VAC 10-210-485 Amended 23:24 VA.R. 4069 9/6/07
23 VAC 10-210-693 emer Amended 23:25 VA.R. 4364 7/26/07-07/25/08
23 VAC 10-210-6041 Amended 23:24 VA.R. 4068 9/6/07
23 VAC 10-210-6042 Amended 23:24 VA.R. 4069 9/6/07
23 VAC 10-210-6043 Amended 23:24 VA.R. 4069 9/6/07
23 VAC 10-240-20 through 23 VAC 10-240-60 Repealed 23:25 VA.R. 4372-4373 10/04/07
23 VAC 10-240-100 Repealed 23:25 VA.R. 4373 10/04/07
23 VAC 10-240-130 Repealed 23:25 VA.R. 4373 10/04/07
23 VAC 10-240-140 Repealed 23:25 VA.R. 4373 10/04/07
23 VAC 10-240-150 Repealed 23:25 VA.R. 4373 10/04/07
23 VAC 10-240-200 Repealed 23:25 VA.R. 4373 10/04/07

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007

18



Cumulative Table of VAC Sections Adopted, Amended, or Repealed

| SECTION NUMBER | ACTION | CITE | EFFECTIVEDATE |
23 VAC 10-240-210 Repealed 23:25 VA.R. 4373 10/04/07
23 VAC 10-240-240 Repealed 23:25 VA.R. 4373 10/04/07
23 VAC 10-240-270 Repealed 23:25 VA.R. 4373 10/04/07
23 VAC 10-240-280 Repealed 23:25 VAR. 4373 10/04/07
23 VAC 10-240-300 Repealed 23:25 VAR, 4374 10/04/07
23 VAC 10-240-310 Repealed 23:25 VAR. 4374 10/04/07
23 VAC 10-240-330 Repealed 23:25 VAR. 4374 10/04/07
23 VAC 10-240-340 Repealed 23:25 VAR. 4374 10/04/07
23 VAC 10-240-360 Repealed 23:25 VAR. 4374 10/04/07
23 VAC 10-240-380 Repealed 23:25 VA.R. 4374 10/04/07
23 VAC 10-240-400 Repealed 23:25 VA.R. 4375 10/04/07
23 VAC 10-240-420 Repealed 23:25 VA.R. 4375 10/04/07
23 VAC 10-240-430 Repealed 23:25 VA.R. 4375 10/04/07
23 VAC 10-240-450 Repealed 23:25 VA.R. 4375 10/04/07
23 VAC 10-240-460 Repealed 23:25 VA.R. 4375 10/04/07
Title 24. Transportation and Motor Vehicles
24 VAC 27-10-10 through 24VVAC27-10-120 Added 23:24 VA.R. 4071-4075 9/20/07
24 VAC 30-155 Erratum 23:21 VA.R. 3619 --
24 VAC 30-155-10 through 24 VAC 30-155-100 Added 23:18 VA.R. 2915-2930 7/1/07
24 VAC 30-320 Repealed 23:16 VA.R. 2665 3/22/07
24 VAC 30-325-10 Added 23:16 VA.R. 2665 3/22/07
24 VVAC 30-325-20 Added 23:16 VA.R. 2666 3/22/07
24 VAC 30-330 Repealed 23:16 VA.R. 2665 3/22/07

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007

19



NOTICES OF INTENDED REGULATORY ACTION

TITLE 9. ENVIRONMENT
STATE WATER CONTROL BOARD

Notice of Intended Regulatory Action

Notice is hereby given in accordance with 82.2-4007.01 of
the Code of Virginia that the State Water Control Board
intends to consider amending the following regulations:
9VAC25-260, Water Quality Standards and 9VAC25-370,
Policy for the Protection of Water Quality in Virginia's
Shellfish Growing Waters. The purpose of the proposed
action is to include a new designation of Aquaculture
Enhancement Zones on the Eastern Shore of Virginia and
narrative criteria to provide additional protection to these
waters that are used or could reasonably be used for shellfish
aquaculture or to support aquaculture by requiring applicants
to demonstrate that practicable alternatives to discharging
pollutants to the listed waters have been evaluated and that
the proposed discharge is the alternative that produces the
least environmental impact.

The agency intends to hold a public hearing on the proposed
action after publication in the Virginia Register.

Statutory Authority: §62.1-44.15 of the Code of Virginia;
Clean Water Act (33 USC 81251 et seq.); 40 CFR Part 131.

Public comments may be submitted until 5 p.m. on October
24, 2007.

Contact: Elleanore M. Daub, Department of Environmental
Quality, 629 E. Main St., P.O. Box 1105, Richmond, VA
23218, telephone 804-698-4111, FAX 804-698-4116, or
email emdaub@deq.virginia.gov.

VAR. Doc. No. R08-783; Filed August 28, 2007, 12:36 p.m.

Withdrawal of Notice of Intended Regulatory Action

Notice is hereby given that the State Water Control Board has
WITHDRAWN the Notice of Intended Regulatory Action for
9VAC25-700, Virginia Water Protection Permit (VWPP)
General Permit Regulations. which was published in 16:20
VA.R. 2429 July 19, 2000. The action is being withdrawn as
requirements were incorporated into 9 VAC 25-690, Virginia
Water Protection General Permit for Impacts from
Development and Certain Mining Activities, effective August
1, 2006.

Contact: Cindy Berndt, Director, Regulatory Affairs,
Department of Environmental Quality, 629 East Main Street,
P.O. Box 1105, Richmond, VA 23218, telephone 804-698-
4378, FAX 804-698-4346 or email
cmberndt@deq.virginia.gov.

VA.R. Doc. No. R00-199; Filed August 17,2007, 1:55 p.m.

Withdrawal of Notice of Intended Regulatory Action

Notice is hereby given that the State Water Control Board has
WITHDRAWN the Notice of Intended Regulatory Action for
9VAC25-710, General VWP Permit for Wetland
Restoration and Creation Activities, which was published
in 16:20 VA.R. 2429 July 19, 2000. The action is being
withdrawn as activities are covered by the Corps of Engineers
NWP 27, conditionally certified by the Department of
Environmental Quality on April 20, 2007.

Contact: Cindy Berndt, Director, Regulatory Affairs,
Department of Environmental Quality, 629 East Main Street,
P.O. Box 1105, Richmond, VA 23218, telephone 804-698-
4378, FAX 804-698-4346 or email
cmberndt@deq.virginia.gov.

VAR. Doc. No. R00-200; Filed August 17,2007, 1:59 p.m.

Withdrawal of Notice of Intended Regulatory Action

Notice is hereby given that the State Water Control Board has
WITHDRAWN the Notice of Intended Regulatory Action for
9VAC25-830, Virginia General Pollution Abatement
Permit Regulation for Industrial and Other Nonirrigation
Reuses of Reclaimed Water, which was published in 22:1
VA.R. 19 September 19, 2005. The action is being withdrawn
as the proposed Water Reclamation and Reuse Regulation,
9VAC25-740, does not require general permit coverage for
end users.

Contact: Cindy Berndt, Director, Regulatory Affairs,
Department of Environmental Quality, 629 East Main Street,
P.O. Box 1105, Richmond, VA 23218, telephone 804-698-
4378, FAX 804-698-4346 or email
cmberndt@deq.virginia.gov.

VAR. Doc. No. R06-34; Filed August 17,2007, 2:13 p.m.

Withdrawal of Notice of Intended Regulatory Action

Notice is hereby given that the State Water Control Board has
WITHDRAWN the Notice of Intended Regulatory Action for
9VAC25-840, General Virginia Pollution Abatement
Permit for Irrigation Reuse of Level A Reclaimed Water,
which was published in 22:1 VA.R. 19 September 19, 2005.
The action is being withdrawn as the proposed Water
Reclamation and Reuse Regulation, 9 VAC25-740, does not
require general permit coverage for end users.

Contact: Cindy Berndt, Director, Regulatory Affairs,
Department of Environmental Quality, 629 East Main Street,
P.O. Box 1105, Richmond, VA 23218, telephone 804-698-
4378, FAX 804-698-4346 or email
cmberndt@deq.virginia.gov.

VA.R. Doc. No. R06-35; Filed August 17, 2007, 2:12 p.m.

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007




Notices of Intended Regulatory Action

Withdrawal of Notice of Intended Regulatory Action

Notice is hereby given that the State Water Control Board has
WITHDRAWN the Notice of Intended Regulatory Action for
9VAC25-850, Virginia General Pollution Abatement
Permit Regulation for Irrigation Reuse of Level B
Reclaimed Water, which was published in 22:1 VA.R. 19
September 19, 2005. The action is being withdrawn as the
proposed Water Reclamation and Reuse Regulation,
9VAC25-740, does not require general permit coverage for
end users.

Contact: Cindy Berndt, Director, Regulatory Affairs,
Department of Environmental Quality, 629 East Main Street,
P.O. Box 1105, Richmond, VA 23218, telephone 804-698-

4378, FAX 804-698-4346 or email
cmberndt@deq.virginia.gov.
VAR. Doc. No. R06-36; Filed August 17,2007, 2:13 p.m.
* *

TITLE 12. HEALTH
STATE BOARD OF HEALTH

Notice of Intended Regulatory Action

Notice is hereby given in accordance with §2.2-4007.01 of
the Code of Virginia that the State Board of Health intends to
consider amending the following regulation: 12VAC5-120,
Regulations for Testing Children for Elevated Blood-Lead
Levels. The purpose of the proposed action is to update the
definition of qualified laboratory and add an exemption and a
requirement for the provision of information to parents.

The agency intends to hold a public hearing on the proposed
action after publication in the Virginia Register.

Statutory Authority: 832.1-46.1 of the Code of Virginia.

Public comments may be submitted until 5 p.m. on October
17, 2007.

Contact: Nancy Van Voorhis, Director, Lead Safe Virginia,
Department of Health, 109 Governor St., Richmond, VA

23219, telephone 804-864-7694 or email
nancy.vanvoorhis@vdh.virginia.gov.
VA.R. Doc. No. R08-917; Filed August 23, 2007, 12:31 p.m.
L 2 L 2

TITLE 18. PROFESSIONAL AND
OCCUPATIONAL LICENSING

BOARD OF FUNERAL DIRECTORS AND
EMBALMERS

Notice of Intended Regulatory Action

Notice is hereby given in accordance with 82.2-4007.01 of
the Code of Virginia that the Board of Funeral Directors and
Embalmers intends to consider amending the following
regulation: 18VAC65-20, Regulations of the Board of
Funeral Directors and Embalmers. The purpose of the
proposed action is to establish some accountability for
facilities, standards for clear identification of remains and
authorization to cremate, acceptable and safe cremation
practices, and appropriate training for operators.

The agency intends to hold a public hearing on the proposed
action after publication in the Virginia Register.

Statutory Authority: §54.1-2400 of the Code of Virginia.

Public comments may be submitted until 5 p.m. on October
17, 2007.

Contact: Elizabeth Young, Executive Director, Board of
Funeral Directors and Embalmers, Perimeter Center, 9960
Mayland Dr., Suite 300, Richmond, VA 23233, telephone
804-367-4562, FAX 804-662-9943, TTY 804-662-7197, or
email elizabeth.young@dhp.virginia.gov.

VA.R. Doc. No. R08-786; Filed August 23, 2007, 3:22 p.m.

BOARD FOR WATERWORKS AND WASTEWATER
WORKS OPERATORS AND ONSITE SEWAGE
SYSTEM PROFESSIONALS

Notice of Intended Regulatory Action

Notice is hereby given in accordance with §2.2-4007.01 of
the Code of Virginia that the Board for Waterworks and
Wastewater Works Operators and Onsite Sewage System
Professionals intends to consider amending the following
regulation: 18VAC160-20, Board for Waterworks and
Wastewater Works Operators Regulations. The purpose of
the proposed action is to set entry requirements and standards
of conduct for onsite soil evaluators, alternative onsite sewage
system installers and alternative onsite sewage system
operators.

The agency intends to hold a public hearing on the proposed
action after publication in the Virginia Register.

Statutory Authority: 8854.1-113 and 54.1-201 of the Code of
Virginia.
Public comments may be submitted until 5 p.m. on November
5, 2007.

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007




Notices of Intended Regulatory Action

Contact: David E. Dick, Executive Director, Board for
Waterworks and Wastewater Works Operators and Onsite
Sewage System Professionals, Perimeter Center, 9960
Mayland Dr., Suite 400, Richmond, VA 23233, telephone
804-367-8595, FAX 804-527-4297, TTY 804-367-9753, or
email waterwasteoper@dpor.virginia.gov.

VA.R. Doc. No. R08-791; Filed August 24, 2007, 1:29 p.m.

* *

Volume 24, Issue 1 Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007

22



REGULATIONS

For information concerning the different types of regulations, see the Information Page.

Symbol Key
Roman type indicates existing text of regulations. Underscored language indicates proposed new text.
Language that has been stricken indicates proposed text for deletion. Brackets are used in final regulations to indicate changes from the
proposed regulation.

TITLE 3. ALCOHOLIC BEVERAGES

ALCOHOLIC BEVERAGE CONTROL BOARD

Notice of Objection to Fast-Track Rulemaking

REGISTRAR'S NOTICE: Pursuant to §2.2-4012.1 of the
Code of Virginia, the Alcoholic Beverage Control Board has
filed a notice of objection to the fast-track rulemaking action
published in 23:25 VA.R. 4105-4111 August 20, 2007. The
board intends to proceed with the normal promulgation
process set out in Article 2 (82.2-4006 et seq.) of Chapter 40
of the Administrative Process Act with the initial publication
of the fast-track regulation serving as the Notice of Intended
Regulatory Action.

TITLE 4. CONSERVATION AND NATURAL
RESOURCES

BOARD OF GAME AND INLAND FISHERIES

Proposed Regulation

Title of Requlation: 3VAC5-50. Retail Operations
(amending 3VAC5-50-40, 3VAC5-50-50, 3VAC5-50-80,
3VAC5-50-100, 3VAC5-50-130, 3VAC5-50-140).

Statutory Authority: §84.1-103 and 4.1-111 of the Code of
Virginia.
Fast-Track Publication Date: 23:25 VA.R. 4105-4111 August
20, 2007.

The Virginia Alcoholic Beverage Control Board is hereby
filing a Notice of Objection to the fast-track rulemaking for
3VAC5-50, Retail Operations. The fast-track regulation was
published in Volume 23, Issue 25, pages 4105-4111 of the
Virginia Register of Regulations dated August 20, 2007. A
30-day comment period was provided with public comment
to be received until September 19, 2007.

As of August 29, 2007, 11 objections had been posted on the
comment forum for this stage. The comments either state that
the proposal not be fast-tracked, but go through the normal
regulatory process, or they object to the amendment to
3VAC5-50-140, which requires a three-foot separation
between nude performers and patrons. Some of the comments
suggest that the proposal go through the normal regulatory
process instead of being fast-tracked, while other comments
object to the amendment to 3VAC5-50-140 itself, which
requires a three-foot separation between nude performers and
patrons.

Agency Contact: W. Curtis Coleburn Ill, Chief Operating
Officer, Department of Alcoholic Beverage Control, 2901
Hermitage Rd., Richmond, VA 23220, telephone (804) 213-
4409, FAX (804) 213-4411, TTY (804) 213-4687, or email
curtis.coleburn@abc.virginia.gov.

VA.R. Doc. No. R07-625; Filed August 29, 2007, 12:12 p.m.

REGISTRAR'S NOTICE: The Board of Game and Inland
Fisheries is exempt from the Administrative Process Act
pursuant to subdivision A 3 of §2.2-4002 of the Code of
Virginia when promulgating regulations regarding the
management of wildlife. The board is required by §2.2-4031
of the Code of Virginia to publish all proposed and final
wildlife management regulations, including length of seasons
and bag limits allowed on the wildlife resources within the
Commonwealth of Virginia.

NOTICE TO THE PUBLIC

The Board of Game and Inland Fisheries has ordered to be
published, pursuant to §829.1-501 and 29.1-502 of the Code
of Virginia, the following proposed amendments to board
regulations. A public comment period on the proposed
regulation opened August 28, 2007, and remains open until
September 27, 2007. Comments submitted must be in writing;
must be accompanied by the name, address and telephone
number of the party offering the comments; should state the
regulatory action desired; and should state the justification for
the desired action. Comments may be submitted online at
www.dgif.virginia.gov, mailed to the Department of Game
and Inland Fisheries, Attn: Policy Analyst and Regulatory
Coordinator, 4016 West Broad Street, Richmond, Virginia
23230, or emailed to regcomments@dgif.virginia.gov.

A public hearing on the advisability of adopting or amending
and adopting the proposed regulation, or any parts thereof,
will be held during a meeting of the board to take place at the
Department of Game and Inland Fisheries, 4000 West Broad
Street, Richmond, Virginia, beginning at 9 a.m. on Tuesday,
October 16, 2007, at which time any interested citizen present
shall be heard. If the board is satisfied that the proposed
regulation, or any parts thereof, is advisable, in the form in
which published or as amended after receipt of the public's
comments, the board may adopt regulation amendments as
final at the October 16 meeting. The regulations or regulation
amendments adopted may be either more liberal or more
restrictive than those proposed and being advertised under
this notice.

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007




Regulations

Title of Regulation: 4VAC15-270. Game: Firearms (adding
4VAC15-270-90).

Statutory Authority: §829.1-103, 29.1-501, 29.1-502, and
29.1-528 of the Code of Virginia.

Public Hearing Information: October 16, 2007 - 9 a.m. -
Department of Game and Inland Fisheries, 4000 West Broad
Street, Richmond, VA

Public comments: Public comments may be submitted until
September 27, 2007.

Agency Contact: Phil Smith, Policy Analyst, Regulatory
Coordinator, Department of Game and Inland Fisheries, 4016
West Broad Street, Richmond, VA 23230, telephone (804)

367-1000, FAX (804) 367-0488, or email
regcomments@dgif.virginia.gov.
Summary:

The proposed amendment fulfills the requirement of
Chapter 642 of the 2007 Acts of Assembly and §29.1-528 A
of the Code of Virginia by promulgating model local
government ordinances for hunting with firearms. The
model ordinances address such matters as the caliber of
the firearm, the type of firearm, and the type of ammunition
used when hunting within a locality; individual Virginia
county or city governments subsequently would have the
option of adopting or not adopting one or more such model
local government ordinances. The proposed amendment
would not enact the model local government ordinances
either statewide or within specific localities; rather, the
applicability of one or more model ordinance in any
Virginia locality would be dependent on the respective
individual county or city governments subsequently
adopting such model ordinance or ordinances.

4VVAC15-270-90. Model ordinances related to hunting
with firearms for counties and cities.

Per the provisions of §29.1-528 A of the Code of Virginia,
the following model ordinances related to hunting with
firearms may be adopted by counties and cities. In accordance
with §29.1-528 B of the Code of Virginia, no such ordinance
shall be enforceable unless the governing body of the locality
notifies the director by reqgistered mail prior to May 1 of the
year in which the ordinance is to take effect.

Model Ordinance 1:

It shall be unlawful to hunt with a rifle larger than .22 caliber
rim fire.

Any person who violates the provisions of this ordinance
shall be guilty of a Class 3 misdemeanor.

Model Ordinance 2:

It shall be unlawful to hunt with a rifle larger than .22 caliber
rim fire, except rifles of a larger caliber may be used for
hunting groundhogs between March 1 — August 31. Any

person who violates the provisions of this ordinance shall be
guilty of a Class 3 misdemeanor.

Model Ordinance 3:

It shall be unlawful to hunt with a rifle larger than .22 caliber
rim fire, except rifles of a larger caliber may be used to hunt
from a stand elevated at least 10 feet from the ground. Any
person who violates the provisions of this ordinance shall be
guilty of a Class 3 misdemeanor.

Model Ordinance 4:

Muzzleloading rifles may only be used to hunt from a stand
elevated at least 10 feet from the ground. Any person who
violates the provisions of this ordinance shall be guilty of a
Class 3 misdemeanor.

Model Ordinance 5:

Muzzleloading rifles firing a single projectile may not be used
to hunt between April 1 — May 31. Any person who violates
the provisions of this ordinance shall be quilty of a Class 3
misdemeanor.

Model Ordinance 6:

It shall be unlawful to hunt with shotguns loaded with slugs.
Any person who violates the provisions of this ordinance
shall be guilty of a Class 3 misdemeanor.

Model Ordinance 7:

It shall be unlawful to engage in hunting with a firearm
within the right-of-way of any primary or secondary highway.
Any person who violates the provisions of this ordinance
shall be guilty of a Class 3 misdemeanor.

Model Ordinance 8:

It shall be unlawful to engage in hunting with a firearm
within 100 yards of any primary or secondary highway. Any
person who violates the provisions of this ordinance shall be
guilty of a Class 3 misdemeanor.

VAR. Doc. No. R08-923; Filed August 29, 2007, 10:30 a.m.

L 4 *

TITLE 8. EDUCATION

GEORGE MASON UNIVERSITY

Final Regulation

REGISTRAR'S NOTICE: George Mason University is
exempt from the Administrative Process Act in accordance
with §2.2-4002 A 6 of the Code of Virginia, which exempts
educational institutions operated by the Commonwealth.

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007




Regulations

Title of Regulation:
Weapons  (adding
8VAC35-60-30).

Statutory Authority: 823-91.29 of the Code of Virginia.
Effective Date: August 28, 2007.

Agency Contact: Kenneth W. Hubble, Agency Regulatory
Coordinator, George Mason University, 4400 University
Drive, Fairfax, VA 22030, telephone (703) 993-3091, or
email khubble@gmu.edu.

Summary:

The regulation establishes the weapons prohibition policy
at George Mason University.

CHAPTER 60
POLICY PROHIBITING WEAPONS
8VAC35-60-10. Definitions.

8VAC35-60. Policy Prohibiting
8VAC35-60-10, 8VAC35-60-20,

The following words and terms when used in this chapter
shall have the following meanings unless the context clearly
indicates otherwise:

"Police officer" means law-enforcement officials appointed
pursuant to Article 3 (815.2-1609 et seq.) of Chapter 16 and
Chapter 17 (815.2-1700 et seq.) of Title 15.2, Chapter 17
(823-232 et seq.) of Title 23, Chapter 2 (829.1-200 et seq.) of
Title 29.1, and Chapter 1 (852-1 et seq.) of Title 52 of the
Code of Virginia and sworn federal law-enforcement officers.

"University property” means any property owned, leased or
controlled by George Mason University.

"Weapon" means any pistol, revolver, or other weapon
designed or intended to propel a missile of any kind, or any
dirk, bowie knife, switchblade knife, ballistic knife, razor
slingshot, spring stick, metal knucks, blackjack, or any
flailing instrument consisting of two or more rigid parts
connected in such manner as to allow them to swing freely,
which may be known as nun chahka, nun chuck, nunchaku,
shuriken, or fighting chain, or any disc, of whatever
configuration, having at least two points or pointed blades
that is designed to be thrown or propelled and that may be
known as throwing star or oriental dart.

8VAC35-60-20. Possession of weapons prohibited.

Possession or carrying of any weapon by any person, except a

8VAC35-60-30. Person lawfully in charge.

In_addition to individuals authorized by university policy,
George Mason University police officers are lawfully in
charge for the purposes of forbidding entry upon or remaining
upon _university property while possessing or carrying
weapons in violation of this prohibition.

VAR. Doc. No. R07-815; Filed August 28, 2007, 7:59 a.m.

* *

TITLE 9. ENVIRONMENT

STATE WATER CONTROL BOARD
Withdrawal of Proposed Regulation

Title of Regulation: 9VAC25-800. Virginia Water
Protection General Permit for Minor Surface Water
Withdrawals (adding 9VAC25-800-10 through 9VAC25-
800-90).

Statutory Authority: 8862.1-44.15 and 62.1-44.15.5 of the
Code of Virginia.

The State Water Control Board has WITHDRAWN the
proposed regulation entitled, 9VAC25-800, Virginia Water
Protection General Permit for Minor Surface Water
Withdrawals, which was published in 22:4 VA.R. 565-574
October 31, 2007. This action is being withdrawn as
necessary regulatory requirements were incorporated into an
amendment of the Virginia Water Protection Permit
Regulation (9VAC25-210) that became effective on July 25,
2007.

Contact: Cindy Berndt, Director of Regulatory Affairs,
Department of Environmental Quality, P.O. Box 1105,
Richmond, VA 23240, telephone (804) 698-4378 or email
cmberndt@deq.virginia.gov.

VA.R. Doc. No. R04-263; Filed August 17, 2007, 2:01 p.m.

* *

TITLE 16. LABOR AND EMPLOYMENT

SAFETY AND HEALTH CODES BOARD

Final Regulation

police officer, is prohibited on university property in

REGISTRAR'S NOTICE: The following regulation is exempt

academic buildings, administrative office buildings, student
residence  buildings, and while attending  sporting,
entertainment or educational events. Entry upon [the
aforementioned ] university property in violation of this
prohibition is expressly forbidden.

from the Administrative Process Act in accordance with §2.2-
4006 A 4 c of the Code of Virginia, which excludes
regulations that are necessary to meet the requirements of
federal law or regulations, provided such regulations do not
differ materially from those required by federal law or
regulation. The Safety and Health Codes Board will receive,
consider and respond to petitions by any interested person at
any time with respect to reconsideration or revision.

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007




Regulations

Title of Requlation: Electrical Standard, Subpart S of Part
1910.

16VAC25-90. Federal |Identical General Industry
Standards (29 CFR Part 1910) (amending 16VAC25-90-
1910.6, Appendix D of 16VAC25-90-1910.66, 16VAC25-
90-1910.302 through 16VAC25-90-1910.308, Subpart S
Appendix A of 16VAC25-90-1910.399).

Statutory Authority: 840.1-22 of the Code of Virginia.
Effective Date: December 15, 2007.

Agency Contact: John J. Crisanti, Policy and Planning
Manager, Department of Labor and Industry, Department of
Labor and Industry, Powers-Taylor Building, 13 South 13th
Street, Richmond, VA 23219, telephone 804-786-4300, FAX
804-786-8418, TTY 804-786-2376, or email
john.crisanti@doli.virginia.gov.

Summary:

Federal OSHA revised and updated the provisions
contained in 29 CFR 1910.302 through 1910.308 of the
existing Subpart S electrical installation standard. It
determined that electrical hazards in the workplace pose a
significant risk of injury or death to employees, and that
the requirements in the revised standard, which draw
heavily from the 2000 edition of the National Fire
Protection association’s (NFPA) Electrical Safety
Requirements for Employee Workplaces (NFPA 70E), and
the 2002 edition of the National Electrical Code (NEC),
are reasonably necessary to provide protection from these
hazards. [Note: The 2000 NFPA 70E is based on the 1999
NEC.]

The update to Subpart S applies to electrical installations
and equipment utilized in workplaces in general industry
and in shipyard employment, longshoring, and marine
terminals. Installations exempted by Subpart S present
special design considerations that are not adequately
addressed in Subpart S, for example, electric power
transmission and  distribution installations.  Such
transmission and distribution installations are typically
installed where they are accessible only to specifically
trained and skilled employees and where unqualified
persons will not have access to these installations.

This revision will provide the first update of the
installation requirements in the general industry electrical
installation standard since 1981. It focuses on safety in the
design and installation of electric equipment in the
workplace. It also includes a new alternative method for
classifying and installing equipment in Class | hazardous
locations; new requirements for ground-fault circuit
interrupters (GFCIs) and new provisions on wiring for
carnivals and similar installations.

Federal OSHA removed and reserved Appendices B and C
of the current Subpart S for future use because they did not
contain any material.

The following sections were also impacted by the revised
final rule:

1. 29 CFR 1910.6, Incorporation by reference, was
amended by revising the introductory text to paragraph
(e). Paragraph (e)(33), which read, "ANSI C1-71,
National Electrical Code, IBR approved for §1910.66
Appendix D(c)(22)(i) and (vii)" was removed and
reserved. The introductory text to paragraph (q) was also
revised by amending the address where NFPA materials
could be purchased. Paragraph (q) (16) which read:
"NFPA 70-1971, National Electrical Code, IBR
approved for §1910.66 App. D(c)(2)" was removed and
reserved.

2. 29 CFR 1910.66, Powered Platforms, Manlifts, and
Vehicle-Mounted Work Platforms, Subpart F of Part
1910, paragraph (c)(22)(i) of Appendix D, Existing
Installations (Mandatory), was amended by substituting
"Subpart S of this Part" for the "National Electrical
Code, NFPA 70 — 1971; ANSI C1 - 1971 (Rev. of C1 -
1968)."

3. 29 CFR 1910.399, Definitions applicable to this
subpart, was amended by adding 13 definitions, all but
one of which are based on NFPA 70E-2000 and the 2002
NEC. These new definitions will help clarify the
requirements in Subpart S. Other nonsubstantive changes
were also made to the definitions.

Note on Incorporation by Reference:

Pursuant to §2.2-4103 of the Code of Virginia, 29 CFR Part
1910, General Industry Standards, is declared a document
generally available to the public and appropriate for
incorporation by reference. For this reason the document will
not be printed in the Virginia Register of Regulations. A copy
of the document is available for inspection at the Department
of Labor and Industry, 13 South 13th Street, Richmond,
Virginia 23219, and in the office of the Registrar of
Regulations, General Assembly Building, 9th and Broad
Streets, Richmond, Virginia 23219.

Statement of Final Agency Action:

On June 26, 2007, the Safety and Health Codes Board
adopted federal OSHA'’s revised final rule to the Electrical
Standard, Subpart S of Part 1910, which was published in the
Federal Register on February 14, 2007 (72 FR 7190-7221).
The amendment corrects and updates the Virginia
Administrative Code at 16VAC25-90-1910.6, 16VAC25-90-
1910.66, 16VAC25-90-1910.302 through 16VAC25-90-
1910.308, and 16VAC25-90-1910.399 to conform to 29 CFR
1910.6, 29 CFR 1910.66, 29 CFR 1910.302 through 29 CFR
1910.308, and 29 CFR 1910.399.

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007




Regulations

Federal Terms and State Equivalents:

When the regulations, as set forth in the revised final rule to
the Electrical Standard, Subpart S of Part 1910, are applied to
the Commissioner of the Department of Labor and Industry
or to Virginia employers, the following federal terms shall be
considered to read as follows:

Federal Terms VOSH Equivalent

29 CFR VOSH Standard

Assistant Commissioner of Labor and
Secretary Industry

Agency Department

August 13, 2007 December 15, 2007
VAR. Doc. No. R08-886; Filed August 22, 2007, 10:04 a.m.

* *

TITLE 18. PROFESSIONAL AND
OCCUPATIONAL LICENSING

BOARD OF MEDICINE
Final Regulation

Title of Requlation: 18VAC85-20. Regulations Governing
the Practice of Medicine, Osteopathic Medicine, Podiatry,
and Chiropractic (amending 18VAC85-20-140).

Statutory Authority: §854.1-2400 and 54.1-2930 of the Code
of Virginia.

Effective Date: October 17, 2007.

Agency Contact: William L. Harp, M.D., Executive Director,

Board of Medicine, 9960 Mayland Drive, Suite 300,
Richmond, VA 23233-1463, telephone (804) 367-4621, FAX

(804) 527-4429, TTY (804) 662-7197, or email
william.harp@dhp.virginia.gov.
Summary:

The amendments require that applicants who sat for the
United States Medical Licensing Examination (USMLE)
must pass Steps 1, 2, and 3 within a 10-year period,
unless the applicant is board certified in a specialty
approved by the American Board of Medical Specialties
or the Bureau of Osteopathic Specialists of the American
Osteopathic Association. The current requirement is
passage within a seven-year period except for "good
cause shown."

Summary of Public Comments and Agency's Response: No
public comments were received by the promulgating agency.

18VAC85-20-140. Examinations, general.

A. The Executive Director of the Board of Medicine or his
designee shall review each application for licensure and in no
case shall an applicant be licensed unless there is evidence

that the applicant has passed an examination equivalent to the
Virginia Board of Medicine examination required at the time
he was examined and meets all requirements of Part Il
(18VACB85-20-120 et seq.) of this chapter. If the executive
director or his designee is not fully satisfied that the applicant
meets all applicable requirements of Part 11l of this chapter
and this part, he shall refer the application to the Credentials
Committee for a determination on licensure.

B. A Doctor of Medicine or Osteopathic Medicine who has
passed the examination of the National Board of Medical
Examiners or of the National Board of Osteopathic Medical
Examiners, FLEX, or the United States Medical Licensing
Examination, or the examination of the Licensing Medical
Council of Canada or other such examinations as prescribed
in §54.1-2913.1 of the Code of Virginia may be accepted for
licensure.

C. A Doctor of Podiatry who has passed the National Board
of Podiatric Medical Examiners examination and has passed a
clinical competence examination equivalent to the Virginia
Board of Medicine examination may be accepted for
licensure.

D. A Doctor of Chiropractic who has met the requirements of
one of the following may be accepted for licensure:

1. An applicant who graduated after January 31, 1996,
shall document successful completion of Parts I, 11, 111, and
IV of the National Board of Chiropractic Examiners
examination (NBCE).

2. An applicant who graduated from January 31, 1991, to
January 31, 1996, shall document successful completion of
Parts I, Il, and 11l of the National Board of Chiropractic
Examiners examination (NBCE).

3. An applicant who graduated from July 1, 1965, to
January 31, 1991, shall document successful completion of
Parts I, II, and Il of the NBCE, or Parts | and Il of the
NBCE and the Special Purpose Examination for
Chiropractic (SPEC), and document evidence of licensure
in another state for at least two years immediately
preceding his application.

4. An applicant who graduated prior to July 1, 1965, shall
document successful completion of the SPEC, and
document evidence of licensure in another state for at least
two years immediately preceding his application.

E. The following provisions shall apply for applicants taking
Step 3 of the United States Medical Licensing Examination or
the Podiatric Medical Licensing Examination;

1. Applicants for licensure in medicine and osteopathic
medicine may be eligible to sit for Step 3 of the United
States Medical Licensing Examination (USMLE) upon
evidence of having passed Steps 1 and 2 of the United
States Medical Licensing Examination (USMLE).

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007




Regulations

2. Applicants who sat for the United States Medical
Licensing Examination (USMLE) shall provide evidence
of passing Steps 1, 2, and 3 within a seven-year 10-year
period except-for-good-cause-shewn unless the applicant is
board certified in a specialty approved by the American
Board of Medical Specialties or the Bureau of Osteopathic
Specialists of the American Osteopathic Association.

3. Applicants shall have completed the required training or
be engaged in their final year of required postgraduate
training.

4. Applicants for licensure in podiatry shall provide
evidence of having passed the National Board of Podiatric
Medical Examiners Examination to be eligible to sit for the
Podiatric Medical Licensing Examination (PMLEXIS) in
Virginia.
VA.R. Doc. No. R06-241; Filed August 24, 2007, 9:26 a.m.
Final Regulation

Title of Regulation: 18VACB85-40. Regulations Governing
the Practice of Respiratory Care Practitioners (amending
18VAC85-40-61 and 18VAC85-40-65).

Statutory Authority: 8§854.1-2400 and 54.1-2954.1 of the
Code of Virginia.

Effective Date: October 17, 2007.

Agency Contact: William L. Harp, M.D., Executive Director,
Board of Medicine, 9960 Mayland Drive, Suite 300,
Richmond, VA 23233-1463, telephone (804) 367-4621, FAX

(804) 527-4429, TTY (804) 662-7197, or emalil
william.harp@dhp.virginia.gov.
Summary:

The amendments add two methods by which an individual can
reactivate or reinstate his respiratory care practitioner
license as follows:

1. Recertification by passage of an examination from the
National Board for Respiratory Care, and

2. Completion of 10 hours of continuing education for each
year in which the license has been inactive, not to exceed
three years without an internship or traineeship.

Summary of Public Comments and Agency's Response: No
public comments were received by the promulgating agency.

18VAC85-40-61. Inactive license.

A= A licensed respiratory therapist who holds a current,
unrestricted license in Virginia shall, upon a request on the
renewal application and submission of the required fee, be
issued an inactive license. The holder of an inactive license
shall not be entitled to perform any act requiring a license to
practice respiratory care in Virginia.

18VACS85-40-65.
reinstatement.

Reinstatement Reactivation or

A. To reactivate an inactive license or to reinstate a license
that has been lapsed for more than two years, a respiratory
care practitioner shall submit evidence of competency to
return to active practice to include one of the following:

1. Information on continued practice in another jurisdiction
during the period in which the license has been inactive or

lapsed:;

2. Ten hours of continuing education for each year in
which the license has been inactive or lapsed, not to exceed
three years; or

3. Recertification by passage of an examination from
NBRC.

B. To reactivate an inactive license, a respiratory care
practitioner shall pay a fee equal to the difference between the
current renewal fee for inactive licensure and the renewal fee
for active licensure.

A—tn-orderto C. To reinstate a license which has been lapsed

for more than two years, a respiratory care practitioner shall

file an application for reinstatement; and pay the fee for

reinstatement of his licensure as prescribed in 18VAC85-40-

35—and—submit—to—theboard—evidence—of competency—to
. incl N ‘ S o §

year-in-which-the-license-has beenlapsed,hot-to-exceed-three
years. The board may specify additional requirements for
reinstatement of a license so lapsed to include education,
experience or reexamination.

B- D. A respiratory care practitioner whose licensure has been
revoked by the board and who wishes to be reinstated shall
make a new application to the board, fulfill additional
requirements as specified in the order from the board and
make payment of the fee for reinstatement of his licensure as
prescribed in 18VAC85-40-35 pursuant to §54.1-2408.2 of
the Code of Virginia.

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007




Regulations

E. The board reserves the right to deny a request for
reactivation or reinstatement to any licensee who has been
determined to have committed an act in violation of §54.1-
2915 of the Code of Virginia or any provisions of this

chapter.

VAR. Doc. No. R06-242; Filed August 20, 2007, 8:01 a.m.

Final Regulation

REGISTRAR'S NOTICE: The Board of Medicine is claiming
an exclusion from the Administrative Process Act in
accordance with §2.2-4006 A 4 a of the Code of Virginia,
which excludes regulations that are necessary to conform to
changes in Virginia statutory law where no agency discretion
is involved. The Board of Medicine will receive, consider and
respond to petitions by any interested person at any time with
respect to reconsideration or revision.

Titles of Requlations: 18VAC85-40. Regulations Governing
the Practice of Respiratory Care Practitioners (amending
18VAC85-40-61).

18VAC85-50. Regulations Governing the Practice of
Physician Assistants (amending 18VAC85-50-58).

18VACB85-80. Regulations Governing the Licensure of
Occupational Therapists (amending 18VAC85-80-72).

18VACS85-101. Regulations Governing the Licensure of
Radiologic Technologists and Radiologic Technologists-
Limited (amending 18VAC85-101-152).

18VACS85-110. Regulations Governing the Practice of
Licensed Acupuncturists (amending 18VAC85-110-155).

Statutory Authority: 8854.1-2400 and 54.1-2912.1 of the
Code of Virginia.

Effective Date: October 18, 2007.

Agency Contact: William L. Harp, M.D., Executive Director,
Board of Medicine, 9960 Mayland Drive, Suite 300,
Richmond, VA 23233-1463, telephone (804) 367-4621, FAX

(804) 527-4429, TTY  804-662-7197, or email
william.harp@dhp.virginia.gov.
Summary:

Section 54.1-2914 of the Code of Virginia was amended
in Chapter 163 of the 2005 Acts of Assembly to
consolidate the provisions on unprofessional conduct
into 854.1-2915. In several regulations of the board, the
sections on inactive licensure provide that the board
reserves the right to deny a request for reactivation to
any licensee who has been determined to have committed
an act in violation of 854.1-2914 of the Code of Virginia
or any provisions of the regulations. The correct Code of
Virginia cite should be §54.1-2915.

18VACB85-40-61. Inactive license.

A. A licensed respiratory therapist who holds a current,
unrestricted license in Virginia shall, upon a request on the
renewal application and submission of the required fee, be
issued an inactive license. The holder of an inactive license
shall not be entitled to perform any act requiring a license to
practice respiratory care in Virginia.

B. To reactivate an inactive license, a licensee shall:
1. Submit the required application;

2. Pay a fee equal to the difference between the current
renewal fee for inactive licensure and the renewal fee for
active licensure; and

3. Submit information on continued practice in another
jurisdiction or other evidence of competency to return to
active practice to include 10 hours of continuing education
for each year in which the license has been inactive, not to
exceed three years.

C. The board reserves the right to deny a request for
reactivation to any licensee who has been determined to have
committed an act in violation of §54-2-2914 §54.1-2915 of
the Code of Virginia or any provisions of this chapter.

18VACB85-50-58. Inactive licensure.

A. A physician assistant who holds a current, unrestricted
license in Virginia shall, upon a request on the renewal
application and submission of the required fee, be issued an
inactive license.

1. The holder of an inactive license shall not be required to
maintain certification by the NCCPA.

2. An inactive licensee shall not be entitled to practice as a
physician assistant in Virginia.

B. An inactive licensee may reactivate his license upon
submission of:

1. The required application;

2. Payment of the difference between the current renewal
fee for inactive licensure and the renewal fee for active
licensure for the biennium in which the license is being
reactivated; and

3. Documentation of having maintained certification or
having been recertified by the NCCPA.

C. The board reserves the right to deny a request for
reactivation to any licensee who has been determined to have
committed an act in violation of §54-1-2914 §54.1-2915 of
the Code of Virginia or any provisions of this chapter.

18VACB85-80-72. Inactive licensure.

A. A licensed occupational therapist who holds a current,
unrestricted license in Virginia shall, upon a request on the
renewal application and submission of the required fee, be

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007




Regulations

issued an inactive license. The holder of an inactive license
shall not be required to maintain hours of active practice or
meet the continued competency requirements of 18VACS85-
80-71 and shall not be entitled to perform any act requiring a
license to practice occupational therapy in Virginia.

B. An inactive licensee may reactivate his license upon
submission of the following:

1. An application as required by the board,;

2. A payment of the difference between the current renewal
fee for inactive licensure and the renewal fee for active
licensure;

3. If the license has been inactive for two to six years,
documentation of having engaged in the active practice of
occupational therapy or having completed a board-
approved practice of 160 hours within 60 consecutive days
under the supervision of a licensed occupational therapist;
and

4. Documentation of completed continued competency
hours equal to the requirement for the number of years, not
to exceed four years, in which the license has been
inactive.

C. An occupational therapist who has had an inactive license
for six years or more and who has not engaged in active
practice, as defined in 18VACB85-80-10, shall serve a board-
approved practice of 320 hours to be completed in four
consecutive months under the supervision of a licensed
occupational therapist.

D. The board reserves the right to deny a request for
reactivation to any licensee who has been determined to have
committed an act in violation of §54-1-2914 §54.1-2915 of
the Code of Virginia or any provisions of this chapter.

18VAC85-101-152. Inactive license.

A. A licensed radiologic technologist or radiologic
technologist-limited who holds a current, unrestricted license
in Virginia may, upon a request on the renewal application
and submission of the required fee, be issued an inactive
license. The holder of an inactive license shall not be required
to maintain continuing education hours and shall not be
entitled to perform any act requiring a license to practice
radiography in Virginia.

B. To reactivate an inactive license, a licensee shall:
1. Submit the required application;

2. Pay a fee equal to the difference between the current
renewal fee for inactive licensure and the renewal fee for
active licensure; and

3. Verify that he has completed continuing education hours
equal to those required for the period in which he held an
inactive license in Virginia, not to exceed one biennium.

C. The board reserves the right to deny a request for
reactivation to any licensee who has been determined to have
committed an act in violation of §54.1-2914 8§54.1-2915 of
the Code of Virginia or any provisions of this chapter.

18VACB85-110-155. Inactive licensure.

A. A licensed acupuncturist who holds a current, unrestricted
license in Virginia shall, upon a request on the renewal
application and submission of the required fee, be issued an
inactive license.

1. The holder of an inactive license shall not be required to
maintain current, active certification by the NCCAOM.

2. An inactive licensee shall not be entitled to perform any
act requiring a license to practice acupuncture in Virginia.

B. An inactive licensee may reactivate his license by:
1. Submission of the required application;

2. Payment of the difference between the current renewal
fee for inactive licensure and the renewal fee for active
licensure for the biennium in which the license is being
reactivated; and

3. Submission of documentation of having maintained
current certification or having been recertified by the
NCCAOM.

C. The board reserves the right to deny a request for
reactivation to any licensee who has been determined to have
committed an act in violation of §54-1-2914 §54.1-2915 of
the Code of Virginia or any provisions of this chapter.

VAR. Doc. No. R08-876; Filed August 24, 2007, 9:27 a.m.

L 4 *

TITLE 22. SOCIAL SERVICES

DEPARTMENT FOR THE AGING
Proposed Regulation

Title of Regqulation: 22VAC5-30. The Virginia Public
Guardian and Conservator Program (adding 22VAC5-30-
10 through 22VAC5-30-60).

Statutory Authority: 82.2-712 of the Code of Virginia.

Public Hearing _Information:

scheduled.

No public hearings are

Public comments: Public comments may be submitted until
5 p.m. on November 16, 2007.

Agency Contact: Janet James, Esq., State Legal Services
Developer, Department for the Aging, 1610 Forest Avenue,
Richmond, VA 23229, telephone (804) 662-7049, FAX (804)
662-9354, TTY (804) 662-9333, or email
janet.james@vda.virginia.gov.

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007




Regulations

Basis: Section 2.2-712 of the Code of Virginia mandates that
the department shall adopt reasonable regulations in
accordance with the Administrative Process Act (§2.2-4000 et
seq. of the Code of Virginia) as appropriate to implement,
administer and manage the state and local or regional
programs with respect to the public guardian and conservator
program.

Purpose: The purpose of this regulation is to protect the
health, safety and welfare of eligible incapacitated persons, in
need of a public guardian, conservator or both, at public
expense, by ensuring uniform standards and safeguards for all
local and regional programs throughout the Commonwealth
of Virginia.

Substance: This regulation sets forth guidance for a statewide
program of local and regional public guardian programs to
ensure that eligible persons who cannot adequately care for
themselves because of incapacity are able to meet essential
requirements for physical and emotional health and
management of financial resources with the assistance of a
guardian or conservator or both, as appropriate, and that there
are uniform standards throughout the statewide program.

Issues: The advantage of this regulation to the public is that it
sets forth unambiguous requirements for the operation of all
local and regional programs throughout the Commonwealth
of Virginia and ensures uniformity in service levels to
incapacitated persons. This regulatory action poses no
disadvantages to the public or the Commonwealth.

Department _of Planning and Budget's Economic Impact
Analysis:

Summary of the Proposed Amendments to Regulation.
Pursuant to Chapter 787 of the 1998 Virginia Acts of
Assembly, the Department for the Aging (Department)
proposes to promulgate new regulations to implement,
administer, and manage the Guardian and Conservator
Program.

Result of Analysis. The benefits likely exceed the costs for all
proposed changes.

Estimated Economic Impact. Chapter 787 of the 1998
Virginia Acts of Assembly created the Virginia Public
Guardian and Conservator Program (Program). Section 2.2-
712 states that the Department shall fund from appropriations
received for such purposes a statewide system of local or
regional public guardian and conservator programs. A
guardian is an individual appointed by the court who is
responsible for the personal affairs of an incapacitated person.
A conservator is an individual appointed by the court who is
responsible for managing the estate and financial affairs of an
incapacitated person.

Chapter 787 further states that

The Department shall promulgate reasonable regulations
in accordance with the Administrative Process Act (§9-

6.14:1 et seq.) as appropriate to implement, administer
and manage the state and local or regional programs
authorized by this article, including, but not limited to:
adoption of minimum training and experience
requirements for volunteers and professional staff of the
local and regional programs; adoption of an ideal range
of staff to client ratios for the programs; adoption of
procedures to be followed whenever a local or regional
program falls below or exceeds the ideal range of staff to
client ratios, which shall include, but not be limited to,
procedures to ensure that services shall continue to be
available to those in need and that appropriate notice is
given to the courts, sheriffs, where appropriate, and the
Department; and adoption of procedures governing
disqualification of any program falling below or
exceeding the ideal range of staff to client ratios, which
shall include a process for evaluating any program which
has exceeded the ratio to assess the effects falling below
or exceeding the ideal range of ratios has had or is having
upon the program and upon the incapacitated persons
served by the program. The regulations shall require that
such evaluations occur no less frequently than every six
months and shall continue until the staff to client ratio
returns to within the ideal range.

Up until now, the Program has been run without regulations.
According to the Department, all of the requirements and
procedures that the legislation mandated be set forth in
regulation have in practice been consistently set forth in
contracts with public guardian service providers. The
Department now proposes to set these requirements in
regulation. Setting the requirements in regulation is beneficial
to the public in that interested parties can much more easily
ascertain the specifics of the requirements. Also, the public
may produce valuable comment in the promulgating process.

With the exception of criminal background checks and drug
screening, all of the requirements in the proposed regulations
are the same as the requirements that have been in the
Department’s contracts with public guardian service
providers since the beginning of the Program.! The proposed
regulations require that for each paid staff member hired on
or after January 1, 2009 who works for a Public Guardian
Program service provider and has direct contact with clients
or client estates, a criminal background check shall be
conducted and the staff member shall be free of illegal drug
use as confirmed by a drug screening test conducted prior to
the assumption of any duties with an incapacitated person.

The Virginia State Police charges $37 per criminal
background check. According to the Department, most if not
all public guardian service providers already conduct criminal
background checks. They are already responsible via contract
to ensure that their employees have not been convicted of a
relevant crime. Since most if not all public guardian service
providers already conduct criminal background checks, this
proposed requirement will not likely have a large effect. If

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007




Regulations

this proposed requirement does increase the frequency of
background checks, then the net impact is likely positive,
since the potential cost in life and property in permitting a
criminal access to vulnerable citizens is very large.

The proposed requirement that staff be free of illegal drug use
as confirmed by a drug screening test conducted prior to the
assumption of any duties with an incapacitated person is
potentially beneficial. Even if the staff member means no
harm, if he is under the influence of drugs his judgment and
the safety of the incapacitated person may be compromised.
An employee passing a drug test prior to initially assuming
duties does not guarantee that he will not later use illegal
drugs; but if an employee cannot discipline himself to be free
of drugs during the known drug test prior to the assumption
of duties, that implies that the employee may have an ongoing
problem with drugs. The cost of a drug test (administered by
the Department via a urine sample) ranges from $10 to $20.
Given the potential danger to incapacitated clients, the benefit
of reducing the likelihood that incapacitated persons are
served by staff under the influence of illegal drugs likely
exceeds the cost of the drug test.

Businesses and Entities Affected. The proposed regulations
affect the 15 public guardian service providers, their
employees, and incapacitated individuals served by the public
guardian service providers. One of the service providers is a
small business; the other 14 are non-profit entities.

Localities Particularly Affected. The proposed regulations do
not disproportionately affect specific localities.

Projected Impact on Employment. The proposed regulations
are unlikely to significantly affect total employment. There
may be a small decrease in the probability that an individual
addicted to illegal drugs will gain employment serving
incapacitated persons.

Effects on the Use and Value of Private Property. The
proposed regulations will likely produce a moderate increase
in the demand for drug testing materials. There may be a very
modest increase in the value of firms that sell these materials.

Small Businesses: Costs and Other Effects. The proposed
required drug testing will increase the cost of hiring new staff
who have direct contact with clients or client estates by $10 to
$20 per employee.

Small Businesses: Alternative Method that Minimizes
Adverse Impact. There is no reasonable alternative method
that minimizes the small adverse impact, while still achieving
the intended policy goal.

Legal Mandate. The Department of Planning and Budget
(DPB) has analyzed the economic impact of this proposed
regulation in accordance with 82.2-4007 H of the
Administrative Process Act and Executive Order Number 36
(06). Section 2.2-4007 H requires that such economic impact
analyses include, but need not be limited to, the projected

number of businesses or other entities to whom the regulation
would apply, the identity of any localities and types of
businesses or other entities particularly affected, the projected
number of persons and employment positions to be affected,
the projected costs to affected businesses or entities to
implement or comply with the regulation, and the impact on
the use and value of private property. Further, if the proposed
regulation has adverse effect on small businesses, §2.2-4007
H requires that such economic impact analyses include (i) an
identification and estimate of the number of small businesses
subject to the regulation; (ii) the projected reporting,
recordkeeping, and other administrative costs required for
small businesses to comply with the regulation, including the
type of professional skills necessary for preparing required
reports and other documents; (iii) a statement of the probable
effect of the regulation on affected small businesses; and (iv)
a description of any less intrusive or less costly alternative
methods of achieving the purpose of the regulation. The
analysis presented above represents DPB’s best estimate of
these economic impacts.

! Source: Virginia Department for the Aging

Agency's Response to the Department of Planning and
Budget's Economic Impact Analysis: The agency agrees with
the economic impact analysis dated May 23, 2007, completed
by the Virginia Department of Planning and Budget.

Summary:

The proposed regulation sets forth requirements for the
statewide Virginia Public Guardian and Conservator
Program to ensure uniformity among programs in serving
eligible persons, at public expense, who need a guardian
or conservator or both, to assist them in meeting essential
requirements for physical and emotional health and
management of financial resources, as appropriate.

CHAPTER 30

THE VIRGINIA PUBLIC GUARDIAN AND
CONSERVATOR PROGRAM

22VVAC5-30-10. Definitions.

The following words and terms when used in this requlation
shall have the following meaning unless the context clearly
indicates otherwise:

"Advisory board” means the Virginia Public Guardian and
Conservator Advisory Board as authorized by §82.2-2411 and
2.2-2412 of the Code of Virginia.

"Client" means a person who has been adjudicated
incapacitated and who is receiving services from a public
guardian program.

"Conservator" means a person appointed by the court who is
responsible for managing the estate and financial affairs of an
incapacitated person and, where the context plainly indicates,

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007




Regulations

includes a "limited conservator” or a "temporary

Code of Virginia unless the court order entered pursuant to

conservator." The term includes (i) a local or regional

this chapter specifically provides otherwise. Incorporated by

program designated by the Department for the Aging as a

reference to this definition is the definition of "incapacitated

public conservator pursuant to Article 2 (82.2-711 et seq.) of

person" found in 837.2-1000 of the Code of Virginia and any

Chapter 7 of Title 2.2 of the Code of Virginia or (ii) any local

successor language thereof.

or_regional tax-exempt charitable organization established
pursuant to 8501(c)(3) of the Internal Revenue Code to
provide conservatorial services to incapacitated persons. Such
tax-exempt charitable organization shall not be a provider of
direct services to the incapacitated person. If a tax-exempt
charitable organization has been designated by the Virginia

"Indigency" means the client is a current recipient of a state-
funded or federally funded public assistance program for the
indigent or as otherwise defined in §19.2-159 of the Code of
Virginia.

"Least restrictive alternatives” means, but is not limited to

Department for the Aging (VDA) as a public conservator, it

money management services including bill payer and

may also serve as a conservator for other individuals.

representative payee services, care management, and services

Incorporated by reference to this definition is the definition of

provided pursuant to a financial or health care power of

"conservator" found in 8§37.2-1000 of the Code of Virginia

attorney.

and any successor language thereof.

"Guardian" means a person appointed by the court who is

"Minimal fee" means allowable fees collected or payable
from government sources and shall not include any funds

responsible for the personal affairs of an incapacitated person,

from an incapacitated person’s estate.

including responsibility for making decisions regarding the
person's support, care, health, safety, habilitation, education,
therapeutic treatment, and, if not inconsistent with an order of
involuntary admission, residence. Where the context plainly
indicates, the term includes a "limited quardian” or a
"temporary quardian." The term includes (i) a local or
regional program designated by the Department for the Aging
as a public guardian pursuant to Article 2 (§2.2-711 et seq.) of
Chapter 7 of Title 2.2 of the Code of Virginia or (ii) any local
or_regional tax-exempt charitable organization established
pursuant to 8501(c)(3) of the Internal Revenue Code to
provide guardian services to incapacitated persons. Such tax-
exempt charitable organization shall not be a provider of
direct services to the incapacitated person. If a tax-exempt
charitable organization has been designated by the Virginia
Department for the Aging as a public guardian, it may also
serve as a quardian for other individuals. Incorporated by
reference to this definition is the definition of "guardian"
found in 837.2-1000 of the Code of Virginia and any
successor language thereof.

"Incapacitated person" means an adult who has been found by
a_court to be incapable of receiving and evaluating
information effectively or responding to people, events, or
environments to such an extent that the individual lacks the
capacity to (i) meet the essential requirements for his health,
care, safety, or therapeutic needs without the assistance or
protection of a guardian or (ii) manage property or financial
affairs or provide for his support or for the support of his
legal dependents without the assistance or protection of a
conservator. A finding that the individual displays poor
judgment alone shall not be considered sufficient evidence
that the individual is an incapacitated person within the
meaning of this definition. A finding that a person is
incapacitated shall be construed as a finding that the person is
"mentally incompetent” as that term is used in Article I,
Section 1 of the Constitution of Virginia and Title 24.2 of the

"Public guardian program' means a local or regional public or
private nonprofit entity or program designated by VDA as a
public guardian, a public conservator or both, pursuant to
882.2-712 and 2.2-713 of the Code of Virginia, and operating
under a contract entered into with VDA.

22VAC5-30-20. Introduction and purpose.

A. Introduction. Pursuant to §2.2-711 of the Code of Virginia,
the General Assembly declared that the policy of the
Commonwealth is to ensure the appointment of a guardian or
conservator to persons who cannot adequately care for
themselves because of incapacity to meet essential living
requirements where (i) the incapacitated person is indigent,
and (ii) there is no other proper and suitable person willing
and able to serve in such capacity.

B. Purpose. This regulation sets forth requirements for the
statewide program of local and regional public guardian
programs and establishes the requirements for local and
regional entities to operate a designated public guardian

program.
22VVAC5-30-30. Public guardian programs.

A. Designation. VDA shall select public guardian programs
in_accordance with the requirements of the Virginia Public
Procurement Act. Only those programs that contract with
VDA will be designated as public gquardian programs.
Funding for public guardian programs is provided by the
appropriation of general funds.

B. Authority. A public guardian program appointed as a
guardian, a conservator, or both as a guardian and
conservator, shall have all the powers and duties specified in
Avrticle 1 (837.2-1000 et seq.) of Chapter 10 of Title 37.2 of
the Code of Virginia, except as otherwise specifically limited

by a court.
C. Structure.

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007




Regulations

1. Each public guardian program shall have a program

contacts” means that the guardian or conservator has an

director who supervises and is responsible for providing

appropriate_amount of contact with the incapacitated

guardianship services to any incapacitated persons

person to know of his capabilities, limitations, needs, and

assigned by the court and to provide overall administration

opportunities; and, to the extent feasible, the guardian or

for the public guardian program. The program director

conservator shall encourage the incapacitated person to

must be a full-time employee of the program and have

participate in decisions to act on his own behalf and to

experience as a service provider or administrator in one or

develop or regain the capacity to manage his personal

more of the following areas: social work, case

affairs.

management, mental health, nursing or other human
service programs. The program director must also
demonstrate by objective criteria, a knowledge and
understanding of Virginia’s quardianship laws, alternatives
to guardianship, and surrogate decision making activities.
The program director shall attend all training and activities

2. Each public guardian program shall have in place a plan
to immediately provide notice to the circuit court(s) in its
jurisdiction and to VDA when the program determines that

it may exceed its maximum ratio of clients to paid staff.

3. VDA shall establish written procedures for public

required by VDA.

2. Each public guardian program shall establish a
multidisciplinary panel to (i) screen cases for the purpose
of ensuring that appointment of a guardian or conservator
is_appropriate_under the circumstances and is the least
restrictive alternative available to assist the incapacitated
person and (ii) annually review cases being handled by the
program to ensure that a guardian or conservator
appointment remains _appropriate. Composition of a

guardian programs to obtain appropriate waivers regarding
deviations in the ratio of clients to paid staff. Procedures
shall comply with §2.2-713 of the Code of Virginia. VDA
shall inform the advisory board whenever a waiver is
issued to a public guardian program. VDA shall review
such waivers every six months until the ratio of clients to
paid staff does not exceed 20 incapacitated persons to
every one paid staff person.

. Appointments.

multidisciplinary panel should include representatives from
various human services agencies serving the city, county,
or region where the public guardian program accepts
referrals. If serving a region, the multidisciplinary panel
shall have at least one representative from each local
jurisdiction within the region. To the extent appropriate
disciplines are available, this panel may include but is not
limited to representation from:

a. Local departments of social services, adult protective
Services;

b. Community services boards;

c. An attorney licensed by the Virginia State Bar;

d. Area agencies on aging;

e. Local health departments;

f. Nursing home, assisted living, and group home
administrators; and

g. Physicians and community representatives.

D. Client ratio to paid staff.

1. Each public guardian program shall maintain a direct
service ratio of clients to paid staff that does not exceed 20
incapacitated persons to every one paid full-time staff
person. A deviation up to and including 30 incapacitated
persons to every one paid full-time staff person may be
authorized by VDA, in writing, where the proposed plan

1. Prior to the public guardian program accepting an
individual for services, the multidisciplinary panel,
described in 22VAC5-30-30 C 2, shall screen referrals to
ensure that:

a. The public guardian program is appointed as guardian,
or_conservator, or both only in those cases where
guardianship is the least restrictive alternative available
to assist the individual;

b. The appointment is consistent with serving the type of
client identified by the established priorities of the public
guardian program;

c. The individual cannot adequately care for himself;

d. The individual is indigent; and

e. There is no other proper or suitable person or entity to
serve as guardian.

2. Appointments by a circuit court shall name the public
guardian program, rather than an individual person, as the
guardian, the conservator or both guardian and
conservator.

3. A public guardian program shall only accept
appointments as guardian, conservator, or both guardian
and conservator that generate no fee or that generate a
minimal fee.

. Services.

for staffing ensures that the guardian or conservator will
maintain sufficient contacts with the incapacitated person.
For the purposes of this section, the term "sufficient

1. A public guardian program shall have a continuing duty
to seek a proper and suitable person who is willing and

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007




Regulations

able to serve as quardian, conservator, or both guardian

22VVAC5-30-40. Personnel standards.

and conservator for the incapacitated person.
2. The multidisciplinary panel, described in 22VVAC5-30-

A. Each paid staff who is working in the public guardian
program and has direct contact with clients or client estates

30 C 2, shall review active cases at least once every 12

shall:

months to determine that:

a. The client continues to be incapacitated;

b. The client continues to be indigent; and

c. There is no other proper or suitable person or entity to
serve as quardian, conservator, or both quardian and
conservator.

3. Each public guardian program shall set priorities with
regard to services to be provided to incapacitated persons
in accordance with its contract with VDA.

4. Each public guardian program shall develop written
procedures and standards to make end-of-life decisions or
other health-related interventions in accordance with the
expressed desires and personal values of the incapacitated
person to the extent known. If expressed desires or
personal values are unknown, then written procedures
should ensure that the guardian or conservator acts in the
incapacitated person’s best interest and _exercises
reasonable care, diligence and prudence on behalf of the
client.

5. The public guardian program shall avoid even the
appearance of a conflict of interest or impropriety when
dealing with the needs of the incapacitated person.
Impropriety or conflict of interest arises where the public
guardian program has some personal or agency interest that
might be perceived as self-serving or adverse to the
position or the best interest of the incapacitated person.
Examples include, but are not limited to, situations where
the public guardian program provides services such as
housing, hospice or medical care directly to the client.
VDA reserves the right to monitor all administrative,
programmatic, and financial activities related to the public
guardian program to ensure compliance with the terms of
the contract between VDA and the public guardian

program.

6. Each public guardian program and its employees are
required to report any suspected abuse, neglect, or
exploitation in accordance with §63.2-1606 of the Code of
Virginia that provides for the protection of aged or
incapacitated adults, mandates reporting, and provides for
a penalty for failure to report.

7. Each public guardian program shall submit data and
reports as required by VDA and maintain compliance with
VDA program guidelines. VDA shall periodically monitor
administrative, programmatic, and financial activities
related to the public gquardian program to ensure
compliance with the terms of the contract between the
public guardian program and VDA.

1. Complete an orientation program concerning guardian
and conservator duties to include the following subjects:

a. Privacy and confidentiality requirements;

b. Recordkeeping;

c. Services provided, and standards for these services;

d. A historical and factual review about the needs of the
elderly and people with disabilities; and

e. Indications of and actions to be taken where adult
abuse, neglect, or exploitation is suspected.

2. Have a satisfactory work record and be a person of good
character; demonstrate a concern for the well-being of
others to the extent that the individual is considered
suitable to be entrusted with the care, guidance, and
protection of an incapacitated person; and have not been
convicted of any criminal offense involving any physical
attack, neglect or abuse of a person, lying, cheating, or
stealing nor convicted of any felony. A criminal record
check will be conducted on each person hired on or after

January 1, 2009.

3. Be free of illegal drug use as confirmed by a drug
screening test conducted prior to the assumption of any
duties with an incapacitated person for each person hired
on or after January 1, 2009.

4. Demonstrate, by objective criteria, knowledge of
Virginia’s __guardianship _laws and alternatives to
guardianship. For each person hired on or after January 1,
2009, minimum education requirements apply and include
a high school diploma or general education diploma (GED)
from a Virginia accredited program and training or course
work on (i) the duties and powers of guardians and
conservators _in__Virginia, (ii) _mandatory reporting
requirements to the Department of Social Services and
Commissioner of Accounts where applicable, and (iii)
working with special needs populations including
individuals with physical and mental disabilities. Program
directors have additional requirements as specified in
22VVAC5-30-30 C 1.

5. Participate in mandatory training programs required by
VDA.

B. Volunteers.

1. Volunteers may be recruited and used to supplement
paid staff. However, volunteers shall not be included in the
public guardian program direct service ratio of 20
incapacitated persons to every one paid staff person as
required under 22VAC5-30-30 D 1.

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations September 17, 2007

35



Regulations

2. Volunteers may not exercise the authority of a guardian

22VAC5-30-60. Evaluation _and monitoring of public

or conservator.

3. Each public guardian program that uses volunteers shall

guardian programs.

VDA shall periodically administer, monitor, evaluate, provide

develop and implement written procedures for volunteer

technical assistance and expertise, and shall ensure fiscal

management and supervision including requirements that

accountability and quality of service of public guardian

each volunteer shall:

a. Complete an orientation program that provides an
overview of the Virginia Public Guardian and
Conservator Program (882.2-711 et seq. of the Code of
Virginia).

b. Complete an orientation program that provides an
overview of the local public guardian program for which
the person intends to serve as a volunteer, including (i)
services provided by the local program, (ii) specific
duties of the volunteer, (iii) privacy and confidentially
requirements, (iv) recordkeeping and documentation
requirements, and (v) indications of and action to be
taken where adult abuse, neglect, or exploitation is

suspected.

c. Have a satisfactory work record and personal record
and be a person of good character and have not been
convicted of any criminal offense involving any physical
attack, neglect or abuse of a person, lying, cheating, or
stealing nor convicted of any felony. A criminal record
check will be conducted on each volunteer accepted by
the local program on or after January 1, 2009.

22VVAC5-30-50. Recordkeeping.

A. Each public guardian program shall maintain an accurate
and complete client record for each incapacitated person.
Records shall be kept confidential. Access to client records
shall be limited to the client’s legal representative; as directed
by court order; as directed by duly authorized government
authorities or as specifically authorized by the Code of
Virginia or federal statutes, including by written consent of
the client’s legal representative. Provision shall be made for
the safe storage of client records or accurate and legible
reproductions for a minimum of five vyears following
termination of the guardian or conservator court order.

B. The client’s record shall contain a Virginia Uniform
Assessment Instrument (UAI), a care plan, a values history,
the annual report by guardians submitted to the Department of
Social Services as required by 837.2-1021 of the Code of
Virginia, the annual accounting to the Commissioner of
Accounts as required by 826-17.4 of the Code of Virginia,
and all applicable court orders and petitions. A client’s record
shall be completed and on file within 60 days of the
program’s appointment as quardian.

C. Each public guardian program shall maintain all records,
provide reports, including audit information and documents in
accordance with its contract with VDA.

programs.
VAR. Doc. No. R05-275; Filed August 23, 2007, 4:35 p.m.

STATE BOARD OF SOCIAL SERVICES

Fast-Track Regulation

Title of Regulation: 22VAC40-72. Standards for Licensed
Assisted Living Facilities (amending 22VAC40-72-930 and
22VAC40-72-960).

Statutory Authority: 8863.2-217 and 63.2-1732 of the Code
of Virginia.

Public Hearing _Information:

scheduled.

No public hearings are

Public comments: Public comments may be submitted until
October 17, 2007.

Effective Date: November 1, 2007.

Agency Contact: Judy McGreal, Program Development
Consultant, Department of Social Services, Division of
Licensing Programs, 7 North Eighth Street, Room 5214,
Richmond, VA 23219, telephone (804) 726-7157, FAX (804)
726-7132, TTY (800) 828-1120, or email
judith.mcgreal@dss.virginia.gov.

Basis: The following sections of the Code of Virginia are the
sources of legal authority to promulgate the regulation: §63.2-
217 (mandatory) says that the state board shall adopt
regulations as may be necessary or desirable to carry out the
purpose of Title 63.2, and §63.2-1732 (mandatory and
discretionary) addresses the state board’s overall authority to
promulgate regulations for assisted living facilities and
specifies content areas to be included in the standards.

Purpose: The amended regulation is needed to remove some
of the generator-related requirements, which were considered
by many assisted living providers to be overly burdensome
due to cost. The Joint Commission on Administrative Rules
(JCAR) has provided the department clarification of
legislative intent regarding Senate Bill 181 (2004) that
requires that each assisted living facility with six or more
residents be able to connect to a temporary emergency
electrical power source for the provision of electricity during
an interruption of the normal electric power supply. JCAR
clarified that the legislation related only to the ability to
connect to a power source, not to actually having a power
source on site or having an agreement to obtain one, or to
being able to provide specific services in an emergency.

Moreover, the word "emergency” means something different
in the Virginia Statewide Building Code than it does in the

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007




Regulations

assisted living facility regulation. Therefore, the regulation
needs to be clarified to ensure that the connection need not be
one capable of supporting "emergency" power, which must
meet higher standards that are typically required of health
care facilities, such as hospitals.

The amended regulation also includes a few changes to the
requirement that an assisted living facility have an emergency
preparedness and response plan. An assisted living facility
must determine what assistance, if any, will be provided to
the facility by the local emergency management office. The
amended regulation will require that the emergency
preparedness and response plan address maintaining and
operating emergency equipment, evacuations and sheltering
in place. These changes are essential to protecting the health,
safety, and welfare of residents in emergency situations.

Rationale for Using Fast-Track Process: The fast-track
process is being used because there is a sense of urgency
regarding the effective date of the proposed changes. The
current situation seems to have created a problem for facilities
as they attempt to make decisions regarding the best way to
proceed to come into compliance with standards. Some of the
generator-related standards would involve a significant cost
for many facilities. It will be a great help both to providers
and licensing inspectors once the proposed regulations
become effective.

The amendments are expected to be noncontroversial since
provider associations have been involved in the proposed
changes and there appears to be agreement regarding the
revisions.

Substance: 22VAC40-72-930 (i) adds that the emergency
preparedness and response plan include a determination of
assistance, if any, that will be provided to the facility by the
local emergency management office; (ii) clarifies that the
plan include an analysis of potential hazards that would
disrupt operation of the facility and include procedures for
both conducting evacuations and sheltering in place; and (iii)
broadens procedures regarding operation and testing of
emergency generators to cover maintaining and operating all
emergency equipment.

22VVAC40-72-960 (i) changes language regarding ability to
connect to a temporary emergency electrical power source for
the provision of electricity to reflect more closely exact Code
language; (ii) clarifies that reference to the Building Code
relates to installation of a connection for temporary electric
power; (iii) removes specific requirements for heating,
cooling, lighting, refrigeration, and operation of medical
equipment in an emergency; (iv) removes requirement for
emergency generator on site or obtained in an emergency that
disrupts normal electrical power; (v) clarifies requirement for
flashlights and battery lanterns; and (vi) removes the
provision for a supply of emergency generator fuel.

Issues: The primary advantage to the removal and
clarification of some of the generator-related standards is a
significant cost savings for many assisted living facilities.
Somewhat strengthened requirements for emergency and
preparedness and response plans will result in greater
protection of the health, safety, and welfare of residents and
staff in an emergency. The advantage to the Commonwealth
is that the proposed requirements are in line with legislative
intent.

Any disadvantages to the public or the Commonwealth are
outweighed by supporting the viability of the portions of the
assisted living facility industry most affected by the original
requirements.

Department of Planning and Budget's Economic Impact
Analysis:

Summary of the Proposed Amendments to Regulation. The
State Board of Social Services (the Board) proposes to
eliminate the current requirement that Assisted Living
Facilities with six or more residents have an emergency
generator available onsite or have a contract to have an
emergency generator available onsite within four hours of
notification. The Board also proposes to add information in
the facility’s emergency preparedness and response plan on
what, if any, assistance will be provided by the local
emergency management office.

Result of Analysis. The benefits likely exceed the costs for all
proposed changes.

Estimated Economic Impact. During the most recent revisions
to these regulations the Board established a rule requiring
Assisted Living Facilities with six or more residents to have
an emergency generator available onsite or to have a contract
to have an emergency generator available onsite within four
hours of notification. However, questions have been raised by
the regulated facilities regarding the true intent of the
legislative language. The Board requested from Joint
Commission on Administrative Rules (JCAR) a clarification
of the legislative intent. JCAR clarified that the intent is to
have an available hook up for a generator in case of an
emergency. Thus, the proposed regulations will eliminate the
current requirement to have an emergency generator available
on site or to have a contract to have one available on short
notice as well as the requirement to have fuel available onsite
to power the generator in case of emergency.

If enforced, the current requirement would have the potential
to introduce significant compliance costs to regulated
facilities. The cost of an appropriate size generator is
estimated to range from $6,000 to $12,000. However, due to
ambiguous legislative intent, the Board has been issuing
waivers for this particular requirement. We are unaware of
any facility actually purchasing an emergency generator.
Thus, the proposed changes will primarily eliminate the
administrative costs of requesting and issuing waivers.

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007




Regulations

The proposed changes also require Assisted Living Facilities
to add information in their emergency preparedness and
response plan on what, if any, assistance will be provided by
the local emergency management office. The development of
a plan is already required and estimated to cost about $145.
Adding minor additional information to an existing plan
would increase administrative costs by a small amount and
could increase the health and safety protection afforded to
residents in case of an emergency in terms of better planning.

Businesses and Entities Affected. The proposed regulations
affect the 620 licensed assisted living facilities in the
Commonwealth, as well as their residents and families.

Localities Particularly Affected. The proposed amendments
affect all Virginia localities.

Projected Impact on Employment. The proposed amendments
are not expected to have any significant impact on
employment.

Effects on the Use and Value of Private Property. The
proposed amendments are not expected to have any
significant impact on the use and value of private property.

Small Businesses: Costs and Other Effects. Most of the
affected facilities are believed to be small businesses. The
same effects discussed above would apply to small
businesses.

Small Businesses: Alternative Method that Minimizes
Adverse Impact. The proposed amendments are not expected
to have an adverse effect on small businesses.

Real Estate Development Costs. The proposed amendments
are not expected to have any affect on real estate development
costs.

Legal Mandate. The Department of Planning and Budget
(DPB) has analyzed the economic impact of this proposed
regulation in accordance with 82.2-4007 H of the
Administrative Process Act and Executive Order Number 36
(06). Section 2.2-4007 H requires that such economic impact
analyses include, but need not be limited to, the projected
number of businesses or other entities to whom the regulation
would apply, the identity of any localities and types of
businesses or other entities particularly affected, the projected
number of persons and employment positions to be affected,
the projected costs to affected businesses or entities to
implement or comply with the regulation, and the impact on
the use and value of private property. Further, if the proposed
regulation has adverse effect on small businesses, §2.2-4007
H requires that such economic impact analyses include (i) an
identification and estimate of the number of small businesses
subject to the regulation; (ii) the projected reporting,
recordkeeping, and other administrative costs required for
small businesses to comply with the regulation, including the
type of professional skills necessary for preparing required
reports and other documents; (iii) a statement of the probable

effect of the regulation on affected small businesses; and (iv)
a description of any less intrusive or less costly alternative
methods of achieving the purpose of the regulation. The
analysis presented above represents DPB’s best estimate of
these economic impacts.

Agency's Response to the Department of Planning and
Budget's Economic Impact Analysis: The Department of
Social Services concurs with the economic impact analysis
prepared by the Department of Planning and Budget.

Summary:

The proposed amendments delete some of the generator-
related requirements for assisted living facilities.
Facilities will no longer be required to have either an
emergency generator on site or an agreement to obtain
one in an emergency that disrupts electrical power. In
addition, specific services to be provided by emergency
electrical power were deleted. Moreover, the
requirement for availability of a 96-hour supply of
emergency generator fuel was removed. A clarification
was made to the requirement regarding compliance with
the Virginia Statewide Building Code so that it is clear
that it relates to the connection for temporary electric
power, not to the emergency electrical power source.

In respect to the emergency plan, an addition was made
to the requirement to contact the local emergency
coordinator, i.e., an element was added to determine any
assistance that would be provided to the facility by the
local emergency management office. Another change in
the plan removed procedures related to the operation
and testing of emergency generators and replaced them
with procedures for maintaining and operating all
emergency equipment.

22VVAC40-72-930. Emergency preparedness and response
plan.

A. The facility shall develop a written emergency
preparedness and response plan that shall address:

1. Documentation of contact with the local emergency
coordinator to determine (i) local disaster risks and, (ii)
communitywide plans to address different disasters and
emergency situations, and (iii) assistance, if any, that the
local emergency management office will provide to the
facility in an emergency.

2. Analysis of the facility's potential hazards, including
severe weather, fire, loss of utilities, flooding, work place
violence or terrorism, severe injuries, or other emergencies

that would disrupt the normal course—of-service-delivery

operation of the facility.

3. Written emergency management policies outlining
specific responsibilities for provision of:

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007




Regulations

a. Administrative direction and management of response
activities;

b. Coordination of logistics during the emergency;

c. Communications;

d. Life safety of residents, staff, volunteers, and visitors;
e. Property protection;

f. Continued provision of services to residents;

g. Community resource accessibility; and

h. Recovery and restoration.

4. Written emergency response procedures for assessing
the situation; protecting residents, staff, volunteers,
visitors, equipment, medications, and vital records; and
restoring services. Emergency procedures shall address:

a. Alerting emergency personnel and facility staff;

b. Warning and notification of residents,
sounding of alarms when appropriate;

including

c. Providing emergency access to secure areas and
opening locked doors;

d. Conducting evacuations e+ and sheltering in place, as
appropriate, and accounting for all residents;

e. Locating and shutting off utilities when necessary;

f. Operating-the-emergency—generator—and-if-available
on-sitetesting-it-periodically Maintaining and operating

emergency equipment effectively and safely;

g. Communicating with staff and community emergency
responders during the emergency; and

h. Conducting relocations to emergency shelters or
alternative sites when necessary and accounting for all
residents.

5. Supporting documents that would be needed in an
emergency, including emergency call lists, building and
site maps necessary to shut off utilities, memoranda of
understanding with relocation sites, and list of major
resources such as suppliers of emergency equipment.

B. Staff and volunteers shall be knowledgeable in and
prepared to implement the emergency preparedness plan in
the event of an emergency.

C. The facility shall develop and implement an orientation
and quarterly review on the emergency preparedness and
response plan for all staff, residents, and volunteers. The
orientation and review shall cover responsibilities for:

1. Alerting emergency personnel and sounding alarms;

2. Implementing evacuation, shelter

relocation procedures;

in place, and

3. Using,
equipment;

maintaining, and operating emergency

4. Accessing emergency medical information, equipment,
and medications for residents;

5. Locating and shutting off utilities; and
6. Utilizing community support services.

D. The facility shall review the emergency preparedness plan
annually or more often as needed and make necessary
revisions. Such revisions shall be communicated to staff,
residents, and volunteers and incorporated into the orientation
and quarterly review for staff, residents, and volunteers.

E. In the event of a disaster, fire, emergency or any other
condition that may jeopardize the health, safety and welfare
of residents, the facility shall take appropriate action to
protect the health, safety and welfare of the residents and take
appropriate actions to remedy the conditions as soon as
possible.

F. After the disaster/emergency is stabilized, the facility shall:
1. Notify family members and legal representatives; and

2. Report the disaster/emergency to the licensing office by
the next working day as specified in 22VAC40-72-100.

22V AC40-72-960. Emergency equipment and supplies.

A. A complete first aid kit shall be on hand at the facility,
located in a designated place that is easily accessible to staff
but not to residents. The kit shall include, but not be limited
to, the following items:

1. Activated charcoal (use only if instructed by physician
or Poison Control Center);

2. Adhesive tape;

3. Antiseptic ointment;

4. Band-aids (assorted sizes);

5. Blankets (disposable or other);

6. Disposable single use breathing barriers/shields for use
with rescue breathing or CPR (CPR mask or other type);

7. Cold pack;
8. Disposable single use waterproof gloves;
9. Gauze pads and roller gauze (assorted sizes);

10. Hand cleaner (e.g., waterless hand sanitizer or
antiseptic towelettes);

11. Plastic bags;
12. Scissors;

13. Small flashlight and extra batteries;

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007




Regulations

14. Syrup of ipecac (use only if instructed by physician or
Poison Control Center);

15. Thermometer;

16. Triangular bandages;

17. Tweezers; and

18. The first aid instructional manual.

Items with expiration dates must not have dates that have
already passed.

B. In facilities that have a motor vehicle that is used to
transport residents and in a motor vehicle used for a field trip,
there shall be a first aid kit on the vehicle, located in a
designated place that is accessible to staff but not residents,
that includes items as specified in subsection A of this
section.

C. First aid kits shall be checked at least monthly to assure
that all items are present and items with expiration dates are
not past their expiration date.

D. Each facility with six or more residents shall be able to
connect by July 1, 2007, to a temporary emergency electrical
power source for the provision of electricity to—provide-the
. i | i ‘ I
disrupts-electrical-power-to-thefacility during an interruption
of the normal electric power supply. The installation of the
emergency-power-souree a connection for temporary electric
power shall be in compliance with the Virginia Uniform
Statewide Building Code, 13VAC5-63.

E. The following emergency lighting shall alse-be available-at
ak-times:

1. Flashlights or battery lanterns with-one-light for-each
| firect] iblo f i .
duty-between-5-p-m—and-7a-m for general use.

2. One flashlight or battery lantern for each employee
directly responsible for resident care who is on duty
between 5 p.m. and 7 a.m.

3. One eoperable flashlight or battery lantern for each
bedroom used by residents and for the living and dining
area unless there is a provision for emergency lighting in
the adjoining hallways.

3-Open 4. The use of open flame lighting is prohibited.

F. There shall be an alternative form of communication in
addition to the telephone such as a cell phone, two-way radio,
or ham radio.

G. The facility shall ensure the availability of a 96-hour
supply of emergency food and drinking water, emergency
generator-fuel; and oxygen for residents using oxygen.

VA.R. Doc. No. R08-836; Filed August 28, 2007, 1:51 p.m.

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007

40



FORMS

TITLE 18. PROFESSIONAL AND
OCCUPATIONAL LICINSING

REAL ESTATE BOARD

EDITOR'S NOTICE: The following forms have been filed by
the Real Estate Board. The forms are available for public
inspection at the Real Estate Board, 9960 Mayland Drive,
Suite 400, Richmond, Virginia 23233, or the Office of the
Registrar of Regulations, General Assembly Building, 2nd
Floor, Richmond, Virginia 23219. Copies of the forms may
be obtained from Tom Perry, Property Registration
Administrator, Real Estate Board, 9960 Mayland Drive, Suite
400, Richmond, Virginia 23233, telephone (804) 786-3535.

Title _of Regulation: 18VAC135-30. Condominium
Regulations.

FORMS
Appendix A:- Public Offering Statement (eff. 9/07).

Volume 24, Issue 1 Virginia Register of Regulations September 17, 2007
41




Forms

CONDOMINIUM REGULATIONS - APPENDIX A

PURCHASER SHOULD READ THIS DOCUMENT FOR HIS OWN PROTECTION

PUBLIC OFFERING STATEMENT

NAME OF CONDOMINIUM:
LOCATION OF CONDOMINIUM:
NAME OF DECLARANT:
ADDRESS OF DECLARANT:

EFFECTIVE DATE OF PUBLIC OFFERING STATEMENT:

AMENDED:

REVISED:

This Public Offering Statement presents information regarding condominium units being offered for
sale by the declarant, Virginia law requires that a Public Offering Statement be given to every Purchaser in
order to provide full and accurate disclosure of the significant features of the condominium units being offered.
The Public Offering Statement is not intended, however, to be all-inclusive. The Purchaser should consult
other sources for details not covered by the Public Offering Statement.

The Public Offering Statement summarizes information and documents furnished by the declarant to
the Virginia Real Estate Board. The Board has carefully reviewed the Public Offering Statement to ensure that
it is an accurate summary but does not guarantee its accuracy. In the event of any inconsistency between the
Public Offering Statement and the material it is intended to summarize, the latter will control.

Under Virginia Law a purchaser of a condominium unit is afforded a ten day period during which he
or she may cancel the contract of sale and obtain a full refund of any sums deposited in connection with the
contract. The ten day period begins running on the contract date or the date of delivery of a Public Offering
Statement, whichever is later. The purchaser should inspect the condominium unit and all common areas and
obtain professional advice. If the purchaser elects to cancel, he or she must deliver notice of cancellation to
the declarant by hand or by United States mail, return receipt requested.

The following are violations of Virginia law and should be reported to the Virginia Real Estate Board,
Perimeter Center, Suite 400, 9960 Mayland Drive, Richmond, Virginia 23233:

-- a misrepresentation made in the Public Offering Statement

-- an oral modification of the Public Offering Statement

--a representation that the Board has passed on the merits of the Condominium units being
offered or endorses the condominium.

PURCHASER SHOULD READ THIS DOCUMENT FOR HIS OWN PROTECTION

Volume 24, Issue 1 Virginia Register of Regulations September 17, 2007
42




Forms

Title of Reqgulation: 18VAC135-40. Time-Share
Regulations.

FORMS
Appendix A —Public Offering Statement (eff. 203 9/07).

Application for Registration of Time-Share.

Volume 24, Issue 1 Virginia Register of Regulations September 17, 2007
43




Forms

TIME-SHARE REGULATIONS - APPENDIX A

PURCHASER SHOULD READ THIS DOCUMENT FOR HIS OWN PROTECTION

PUBLIC OFFERING STATEMENT

NAME OF TIME-SHARE PROJECT:
LOCATION OF TIME-SHARE PROJECT:
NAME OF DEVELOPER:
EFFECTIVE DATE OF PUBLIC OFFERING STATEMENT:
AMENDED:
REVISED:

This Public Offering Statement presents information regarding Time-Share (s) being
offered for sale by the Developer. The Virginia Real Estate Time-Share Act, §§ 55-360 et
seq. of the Code of Virginia, requires that a Public Offering Statement be given to every
Purchaser in order to provide full and accurate disclosure of the characteristics of and material
circumstances affecting the Time-Share Project and the characteristics of the Time-Share(s)
being offered. The Public Offering Statement is not intended, however, to be all inclusive.
The Purchaser should consult other sources for details not covered by the Public Offering
Statement.

The Public Offering Statement summarizes information and documents furnished by the
developer to the Virginia Real Estate Board. The Board has carefully reviewed the Public
Offering Statement to ensure that it is an accurate summary but does not guarantee its
accuracy. In the event of any inconsistency between the Public Offering Statement and the
material it is intended to summarize, the material shall control.

Under § 55-376 of the Virginia Real Estate Time-Share Act, a Purchaser of a Time-
Share may cancel the Contract until midnight of the seventh calendar day following the
execution of such Contract. If the Purchaser elects to cancel the Contract, he can obtain all
payments made in connection with the Contract before cancellation. If the purchaser elects to
cancel the Contract, he shall only do so either (i) by hand-delivering the notice to the
developer at its principal office or at the project or (i) by mailing the notice by certified
United States mail, return receipt requested, to the developer or its designated agent.

The following are violations of Virginia law and should be reported to the Virginia Real
Estate Board, Perimeter Center, Suite 400, 9960 Mayland Drive, Richmond, Virginia 23233:

= a misrepresentation made in the Public Offering Statement;

= an oral modification of the Public Offering Statement; or

* arepresentation that the Board has passed on the merits of the Time-Share(s) being
offered or endorses the Time-Share project.

PURCHASER SHOULD READ THIS DOCUMENT FOR HIS OWN PROTECTION

1

Volume 24, Issue 1 Virginia Register of Regulations September 17, 2007
44




GENERAL NOTICES/ERRATA

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY

Total Maximum Daily Load - Accomack County

The Department of Environmental Quality (DEQ), Virginia
Department of Health and the Department of Conservation
and Recreation seek written and oral comments from
interested persons on the development of total maximum
daily loads (TMDL) for fecal coliform bacteria in eight
shellfish propagation waters located in Accomack County,
Virginia.

The impaired segments are located in the following VDH
Growing Areas:

Growing Area 77, containing Deep Creek, Hunting Creek,
and Bagwell Creek;

Growing Area 79, containing Chesconessex Creek;
Growing Area 97, containing Folly Creek; and

Growing Area 100,
Greenbackville Harbor.

containing Swans Gut and

The affected water body segments are identified in Virginia’s
1998 303(d) TMDL Priority List and Report as impaired due
to violations of the state’s water quality standard for fecal
coliform bacteria in shellfish waters. Section 303(d) of the
Clean Water Act and 862.1-44.19:7 C of the Code of Virginia
require DEQ to develop TMDLSs for pollutants responsible for
each impaired water contained in Virginia’s 303(d) TMDL
Priority List and Report.

This is the second public meeting to provide information and
solicit comments from citizens and local government on the
draft reports of the fecal coliform TMDL’s studies and is to
be held on September 25, 2007, from 7 p.m. to 9 p.m. at the
Accomac-Northampton Planning District Commission, 23372
Front Street, Accomac, VA 23301.

The public comment period will begin on September 25,
2007, and end on October 24, 2007. Questions or information
requests should be addressed to Chester Bigelow and should
include the name, address, and telephone number of the
person submitting the comments. Requests should be sent to
Chester Bigelow, Department of Environmental Quality, 629
East Main Street, Richmond, VA 23240, telephone (804)
698-4554, FAX (804) 698-4116, or email
cchigelow@deq.virginia.gov.

Restore Water Quality in Bull Creek in Buchanan
County

Public meeting location: Harman Memorial Baptist Church
Christian Center, on Route 609 off Route 460 in Maxie,
Virginia, on October 4, 2007, from 7 p.m. to 9 p.m.

Purpose of notice: The Virginia Department of Environmental
Quality, Department of Mines, Minerals and Energy and the

Department of Conservation and Recreation are announcing a
study to restore water quality, a public comment opportunity,
and public meeting.

Meeting description: Final public meeting on a study to
restore water quality.

Description of study: DEQ is working to identify sources of
pollutants affecting the aquatic organisms in the waters of
Bull Creek. Bull Creek is in Buchanan County and flows
along Route 609 to Levisa Fork downstream of Grundy,
Virginia. The "impaired" stream segments are estimated to be
approximately 16.9 miles including Bull Creek, from the
headwaters to the confluence with Levisa Fork, and all
tributaries; Belcher Branch, Deel Fork, Burnt Poplar Branch,
Big Branch, Starr Branch, Jess Fork, and Convict Hollow.
The stream is impaired for failing to meet the aquatic life use
based on violations of the general standard for aquatic
organisms.

During the study, the pollutants impairing the aquatic
community will be identified and total maximum daily loads,
or TMDLs, developed for the impaired waters. A TMDL is
the total amount of a pollutant a water body can contain and
still meet water quality standards. To restore water quality,
contamination levels must be reduced to the TMDL amount.

How a decision is made: The development of a TMDL
includes public meetings and a public comment period once
the study report is drafted. After public comments have been
considered and addressed, DEQ will submit the TMDL report
to the U.S. Environmental Protection Agency for approval.

How to comment: DEQ accepts written comments by email,
fax or postal mail. Written comments should include the
name, address and telephone number of the person
commenting and be received by DEQ during the comment
period, October 4, 2007, to November 5, 2007. DEQ also
accepts written and oral comments at the public meeting
announced in this notice.

To review fact sheets: Fact sheets are available on the
impaired waters from the contacts below or on the DEQ
website at www.deq.virginia.gov/tmdl.

Contact for additional information: Shelley D. Williams,
Regional TMDL Coordinator, Virginia Department of
Environmental Quality, Southwest Regional Office, 355
Deadmore Street, P.O. Box 1688, Abingdon, VA 24212-
1688, telephone (276) 676-4845, FAX (276) 676-4899, or
email sdwilliams@deq.virginia.gov.

Total Maximum Daily Load - Hardware and North
Fork Hardware Rivers

The Department of Environmental Quality (DEQ) and the
Department of Conservation and Recreation (DCR) seek
written and oral comments from interested persons on the
development of total maximum daily loads (TMDLs) for the

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007




General Notices/Errata

Hardware and North Fork Hardware Rivers in Albemarle and
Fluvanna Counties. The Hardware River was listed on the
2002 303(d) TMDL Priority List and Report as impaired due
to violations of the state’s water quality standard for bacteria.
This impairment extends for 23.11 miles from the headwaters
to the confluence with the James River. The North Fork
Hardware River was listed on the 2004 303(d) TMDL
Priority List and Report as impaired due to violations of the
state’s water quality standard for bacteria. This impairment
extends for 10.39 miles from the headwaters to the
confluence with the Hardware River.

Section 303(d) of the Clean Water Act and §62.1-44.19:7 C
of the Code of Virginia require DEQ to develop TMDLs for
pollutants responsible for each impaired water contained in
Virginia’s 303(d) TMDL Priority List and Report. DEQ has
developed bacteria TMDLSs to address the impairments in the
North Fork Hardware and Hardware Rivers and is soliciting
public comment on the draft TMDL report. The draft report
will be available for review and download from the DEQ
website at
http://gisweb.deq.virginia.gov/tmdlapp/tmd|_draft_reports.cf
m beginning on or before September 25, 2007.

The final public meeting on the development of these TMDLSs
will be held on Tuesday, September 25, 2007, at 7 p.m. at the
Scottsville Town Council Chambers, 401 Valley Street,
Scottsville, VA.

The public comment period for the first public meeting will
end on October 25, 2007. Written comments should include
the name, address, and telephone number of the person
submitting the comments and should be sent to Robert Brent,
Department of Environmental Quality, 4411 Early Road, P.O.
Box 3000, Harrisonburg, VA 22801, telephone (540) 574-
7848, FAX (540) 574-7878, or email
rnbrent@deq.virginia.gov.

Total Maximum Daily Load - King George County

Purpose of notice: The Virginia Department of Environmental
Quality (DEQ), Virginia Department of Health (VDH) and
the Virginia Department of Conservation and Recreation
announce a total maximum daily load (TMDL) study for fecal
coliform bacteria in shellfish propagation waters located in
King George County, Virginia.

Technical advisory committee meeting: Thursday, September
27, 2007, 10 a.m. - Noon, King George County Cooperative
Extension Office, 10087 Kings Highway, King George,
Virginia 22485.

Meeting description: This is the first technical advisory
committee (TAC) meeting for this project. The purpose of the
TAC will be to provide technical input and insight for the
project, and to assist with stakeholder and public
participation.

Description of study: The impaired segments are located in
VDH Growing Area 001A-036 and include portions of Upper
Machodoc Creek, and its tributaries, Williams Creek, Deep
Creek, and Gambo Creek. These impaired waterbodies are
located in King George County, Virginia.

The affected water body segments are identified in Virginia’s
1998 303(d) TMDL Priority List and Report as impaired due
to exceedances of the state’s water quality standard for fecal
coliform bacteria in shellfish waters. Section 303(d) of the
Clean Water Act and 862.1-44.19:7 C of the Code of Virginia
require DEQ to develop TMDLs for pollutants responsible for
each impaired water contained in Virginia’s 303(d) TMDL
Priority List and Report.

How to comment: The public comment period on the
materials presented at the TAC meeting will extend from
September 27, 2007, to October 26, 2007. DEQ accepts
written comments by email, fax, or postal mail. Written
comments should include the name, address, and telephone
number of the person commenting, and be received by DEQ
during the comment period. Please send all comments to the
contact listed below.

Contact for additional information: Chester Bigelow, Virginia
Department of Environmental Quality, 629 East Main Street,
Richmond, VA 23240, telephone (804) 698-4554, or email
cchigelow@deq.virginia.gov.

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY AND
THE STATE AIR POLLUTION CONTROL BOARD

Mercury Symposium

The Department of Environmental Quality and the State Air
Pollution Control Board will conduct a mercury symposium
on November 28, 2007, through November 29, 2007, at the
Omni Newport News Hotel (1000 Omni Boulevard, Newport
News, VA).

The symposium’s purpose is to raise awareness and
understanding of Virginia mercury air emissions, emissions
prevention and control techniques, transport and deposition,
and health effects and risk assessment. It will provide interim
results from the ongoing DEQ mercury study, which is being
performed in response to General Assembly request. The
study will include an examination of mercury sources and
deposition as well as environmental and economic
assessments of existing mercury controls. Experts from
Resources for the Future, the Institute of Clean Air
Companies, the Smithsonian Institution, ICF International,
the Virginia Institute of Marine Sciences, environmental
nongovernmental organizations, Electric Power Research
Institute, Virginia Tech, and Virginia Commonwealth
University are among the planned speakers.

Please note that this symposium is oriented toward air
emissions and their impacts. It will not address mercury-

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007




General Notices/Errata

containing products; surface mercury releases and cleanup of
contaminated sites; or recovery, recycling, treatment, and
disposal of mercury-bearing wastes, among other mercury-
related topics.

Invited  participants  will  include = Commonwealth
environmental board members, relevant state agency staff,
industry, nongovernmental organizations, academics, and
policy research professionals. The symposium will also be
open to interested members of the public as observers.

Agency Contact: Rodney Sobin, Environmental Engineer
Consultant, Department of Environmental Quality, 629 East
Main Street, P.O. Box 1105, Richmond, VA 23218, telephone
(804) 698-4382, FAX (804) 698-4264, or email
rsobin@deq.virginia.gov.

BOARD OF HOUSING AND COMMUNITY
DEVELOPMENT

USBC and SFPC Change Proposals

The Virginia Board of Housing and Community
Development seeks written comment from interested persons
on The Virginia Statewide Building Code (USBC) and The
Virginia Statewide Fire Prevention Code (SFPC) change
proposals received in response to proposed regulations
published in the Virginia Register 23:20 and 23:23.

The board has developed a "compilation document"
containing all proposed changes and supporting
documentation received during the comment period on the
proposed regulations. The compilation document is available
on the department’s website
(http://www.dhcd.virginia.gov/statebuildingcodesandregulations/
codechangecycle.htm) and on other selected websites.

Comments on code change proposals will be received through
October 17, 2007, and should be submitted to Steve Calhoun,
Regulatory Coordinator, Department of Housing and
Community Development, 501 N. 2nd St., Richmond, VA
23219, telephone (804) 371-7015, FAX (804) 371-7090 or
email steve.calhoun@dhcd.virginia.gov. For additional
information or assistance in obtaining the compilation
document, please contact the department’s Division of
Building and Fire Regulation at (804) 371-7150.

STATE LOTTERY DEPARTMENT

Director's Orders

The following Director's Orders of the State Lottery
Department were filed with the Virginia Registrar of
Regulations on August 21, 2007. The orders may be viewed
at the State Lottery Department, 900 E. Main Street,
Richmond, Virginia, or at the office of the Registrar of
Regulations, 910 Capitol Street, 2nd Floor, Richmond,
Virginia.

Final Rules for Game Operation:
Director's Order Number Forty-Five (07)

Virginia's Instant Game Lottery 799; "Super Blackjack"
(effective 8/16/07)

DEPARTMENT OF MEDICAL ASSISTANCE
SERVICES

The Virginia State Plan for Medical Assistance

The Virginia Department of Medical Assistance Services
(DMAS) hereby affords the public notice of its intention to
amend the Virginia State Plan for Medical Assistance to
provide for changes to the Methods and Standards for
Establishing Payment Rates—Other Types of Care, Fee-for-
Service Providers: Pharmacy. The changes contained in this
public notice are occurring in response to the federal budget
amendment (Public Law 110-28) entitled: "U.S. Troop
Readiness, Veterans’ Care, Katrina Recovery, and Iraq
Accountability Appropriations Act" of 2007. That Act
prohibits federal financial participation for outpatient drugs
where the written prescription for the drug was not written on
a tamper-resistant prescription pad. This mandate will go into
effect October 1, 2007. As of October 1, 2007, DMAS will no
longer reimburse pharmacies for outpatient drugs where the
written (nonelectronic) prescription was not written on a
tamper-resistant prescription pad. This change is being made
pursuant to the department’s authority under Title XIX of the
Social Security Act.

This notice is intended to satisfy the requirements of 42 CFR
447.205 and of §1902(a)(13) of the Social Security Act, 42
USC 8§1396a(a)(13). A copy of this notice is available for
public review from Rachel Cain, Health Care Services
Division, Pharmacy Unit, Department of Medical Assistance
Services, 600 Broad Street, Suite 1300, Richmond, VA
23219, and this notice is available for public review on the
Regulatory Town Hall (www.townhall.com). Comments or
inquiries may be submitted, in writing, within 30 days of this
notice publication to Ms. Cain and such comments are
available for review at the same address.

Agency Contact: Rachel Cain, Health Care Services Division,
Pharmacy Unit, Department of Medical Assistance Services,
600 East Broad Street, Suite 1300, Richmond, VA 23219,
telephone (804) 371-0918, FAX (804) 786-1680, or email
rachel.cain@dmas.virginia.gov.

DEPARTMENT OF SOCIAL SERVICES

Periodic Review of Regulations

Pursuant to Executive Order Number 36 (2006), the
Department of Social Services is currently reviewing
22VVAC40-685, Virginia Energy Assistance Program - Home
Energy Assistance Program, to determine if it should be

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007




General Notices/Errata

terminated, amended, or retained in current form. The review
will be guided by the principles listed in Executive Order
Number 36 (2006) and in the department’s Plan for Review
of Existing Agency Regulations.

The department seeks public comment regarding the
regulation’s interference in private enterprise and life,
essential need of the regulation, less burdensome and
intrusive alternative to the regulation, specific and measurable
goals that the regulation is intended to achieve, and whether
the regulation is clearly written and easily understandable.

Written comments may be submitted until October 8, 2007, in
care of Sandy Graham, Energy Assistance Consultant,
Department of Social Services, Division of Benefit Programs,
7 North Eighth Street, Richmond, VA 23219, by facsimile to
(804) 726-7358, or email to sandy.graham@dss.virginia.gov.

VIRGINIA WASTE MANAGEMENT BOARD

Proposed Consent Special Order - Pohanka
Collision Center, Inc.

Purpose of notice: To invite citizens to comment on a
proposed consent order for an Auto Body Shop in
Fredericksburg, Virginia.

Public comment period: September 18, 2007, through
October 19, 2007.

Consent order description: The State Waste Management
Board proposes to issue a consent order to Pohanka Collision
Center, Inc., to address alleged violations of Virginia’s
regulations. Pohanka Collision Center Inc., is an auto body
shop located in Fredericksburg, Virginia. The consent order
describes a settlement to resolve hazardous waste violations.

How to comment: DEQ accepts comments from the public by
email, fax, or postal mail. All comments must include the
name, address, and telephone number of the person
commenting and be received by DEQ within the comment
period. The public may review the proposed consent order at
the DEQ office named below or on the DEQ website at
www.deq.virginia.gov.

Contact for public comments, document requests, and
additional information: Stephanie Bellotti, Department of
Environmental Quality, Northern Virginia Regional Office,
13901 Crown Court, Woodbridge, VA 22193, telephone
(703) 583-3857, FAX (703) 583-3841, or email
sabellotti@deq.virginia.gov.

STATE WATER CONTROL BOARD

Draft Addendum to an Application for a VPDES or
VPA Permit

The proposed Water Reclamation and Reuse Regulation
(9VAC25-740) was published in the Virginia Register of

Regulations on August 6, 2007. A draft addendum form has
been developed and is available at the following web address
for review:
http://www.deq.virginia.gov/water/pdf/Application%20for%?2
ORecl.%20%20Reuse%20Permit%208-24-07.pdf

Any comments or suggestions on the form should be
submitted to the contact person below.

Agency Contact: Valerie Rourke, Department of
Environmental Quality, 629 East Main Street, P.O. Box 1105,
Richmond, VA 23218, telephone (804) 698-4158, FAX (804)
698-4116, or email varourke@deq.virginia.gov.

Proposed Consent Special Order - Russell County
Development Group, LLC

Purpose of notice: To seek public comment on a proposed
consent order from the Department of Environmental Quality
for a facility in Russell County, Virginia.

Public comment period: September 17, 2007, through
October 17, 2007.

Consent order description: The State Water Control Board
proposes to issue a consent order to Russell County
Development Group, LLC to address alleged violations of
Virginia’s regulations. The location of the facility where the
alleged violations occurred is the Gardenside Village
Residential Development, located at Technology Park Drive
in Lebanon, Virginia. The consent order describes a
settlement to resolve the issue of stream and wetland impacts
that occurred without permit authorization.

How to comment: DEQ accepts comments from the public by
email, fax or postal mail. All comments must include the
name, address and telephone number of the person
commenting and be received by DEQ within the comment
period. The public may review the proposed consent order at
the DEQ office named below or on the DEQ website at
www.deq.virginia.gov.

Contact for public comments, document requests and
additional information: Dallas R. Sizemore, Department of
Environmental Quality, Southwest Regional Office, P.O. Box
1688, Abingdon, VA 24212-1688 (the office is located at 355
Deadmore Street, Abingdon, VA), telephone (276) 676-4800,
FAX (276) 676-4899, or email drsizemore@deq.virginia.gov.

VIRGINIA CODE COMMISSION

Elimination of the Calendar of Events Section

Effective July 1, 2007, the Calendar of Events section will no
longer be published in the Virginia Register of Regulations.
Chapter 300 of the 2007 Acts of Assembly amended the
Administrative Process Act by eliminating the requirement
that all state agency meeting notices be published in the
Virginia Register. In lieu of publication in the Virginia

Volume 24, Issue 1

Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007




General Notices/Errata

Register, the Virginia Freedom of Information Act was
amended to require that agencies post meeting notices on the
agency's website and on the Commonwealth Calendar
maintained by the Virginia Information Technologies
Agency. To access the Commonwealth Calendar, please visit
the  Commonwealth of Virginia's homepage at
www.virginia.gov and click on the calendar on the right side
of the screen. Public hearing information will still be
published in the Register and can be found with the
corresponding proposed regulation.

Notice to State Agencies

Mailing Address: Virginia Code Commission, 910 Capitol
Street, General Assembly Building, 2nd Floor, Richmond,
VA 23219.

Filing Material for Publication in the Virginia
Register of Regulations

Agencies are required to use the Regulation Information
System (RIS) when filing regulations for publication in the
Virginia Register of Regulations. The Office of the Virginia
Register of Regulations implemented a new web-based
application called RIS for filing regulations and related items
for publication in the Virginia Register. The Registrar's office
has worked closely with the Department of Planning and
Budget (DPB) to coordinate the new system with DPB's latest
upgrade to the Virginia Regulatory Town Hall. RIS and Town
Hall complement and enhance one another by sharing
pertinent regulatory information. The new system was
released on July 3, 2007.

Advantages of RIS include:

e Daily updates to the online version of the Virginia
Administrative Code (VAC) will provide access to a
"real time" administrative code database.

e Agencies will draft regulation sections using the
always current VAC database through each stage of
the regulatory process.

e Agencies will eventually be able to file most notices
and regulatory actions electronically.

The Office of the Virginia Register is working toward the
eventual elimination of the requirement that agencies file
print copies of regulatory packages. Until that time, agencies
may file petitions for rulemaking, notices of intended
regulatory actions and general notices in electronic form only;
however, until further notice, agencies must continue to file
print copies of proposed, final, fast-track and emergency
regulatory packages.

Volume 24, Issue 1 Virginia Register of Regulations

September 17, 2007




General Notices/Errata

Volume 24, Issue 1 Virginia Register of Regulations September 17, 2007

50





